

































































































































































































































































































































































Combine
Applications

e Incorporate Rockville Application into MTA
Application

e MTA project is larger is scope
e Combined projects address all expected

program outcomes and increases the
chance of receiving the grant

rockvillemd.gov

N

119



Multi — Agency & Rockville Station
Jurisdiction Project

e City of Rockville

e Maryland Department of
Transportation, Maryland Transit
Administration (MARC)

e Montgomery County

e WMATA

e Amtrak

e (CSX

9 rockvillemd.gov

120



Study Timeline R

Application
Due

Grant Award

City of Rockville / MTA Coordination >

FRA Agreement / MTA
Agreement

Consultant Selection

Study Initiates >
02/2026 H 06/2026 M 12/2026 H 2/2027 H 4/2027 }—»

10 rockvillemd.gov

121



Mayor and Council N - R
Action

e Motion that the Mayor and Council
adopt a resolution supporting the
City’s inclusion as a project partner in
MTA'’s Federal Railroad
Administration FY 24-25 Federal-
State Partnership for Intercity
Passenger Rail Program grant
application and authorize the City
Manager to sign a letter of support to
be included in the MTA’s FRA grant
application.

11 rockvillemd.gov

122



Thank You!

>
o
©p
o
S
Q2
S
x
@)
o)
—_

123



MAYOR AND COUNCIL Meeting Date: December 15, 2025
Agenda Item Type: INTRODUCTION

Department: CPDS - INSPECTION SERVICES

Responsible Staff: CHRIS DEMPWOLF

Subject

Introduction of an Ordinance to Amend Chapter 5 of the Rockville City Code Entitled “Buildings
and Building Regulations,” Article XIV (Green Building Code Regulations)

Department
CPDS - Inspection Services

Recommendation
Staff recommends that the Mayor and Council introduce amendments (Attachment 1) to
Chapter 5, Article XIV of the City Code, Entitled “Green Building Regulations”.

Change in Law or Policy

The proposed amendments will update the Green Building Regulations in the City of Rockville
by adopting and amending current versions of the model codes published by the International
Code Council (ICC).

Discussion

During the 2024 updates to Chapter 5 of the Rockville City Code, staff recommended evaluating
Article XIV — Green Building Regulations separate from the amendments to the other 13
articles, to provide thoughtful and meaningful updates. The City’s Climate Action Plan calls for
progressively strengthened Green Building codes in Action Item C-03. The 2024 updates to
Chapter 5 included several amendments to the City’s Energy Conservation Code which are
substantially more progressive than the base text of the International Green Building Code
(IgCC) and the National Green Building Standard (NGBS) and will continue to make Rockville a
regional leader in this area.

The 2021 edition of the IgCC and the 2020 edition of the NGBS are more substantial than prior
editions and warranted more in-depth review. Staff has completed its reviews of these
documents and recommends amendments to Article XIV, the IgCC, and the NGBS as shown in
Attachement 1 and summarized below. This summary provides only significant changes and
does not include grammatical or administrative changes.

Article XIV

Key Updates/Recommendations:

124



e Relocation of scoping requirements
e Relocation of definitions
e Requirement to obtain third-party certification

International Green Construction Code (IgCC)

Key Updates/Recommendations:
e Deletion of majority of Chapter 5 (Site Conditions), addressed elsewhere in City Code
e Providing flexibility to use off-site renewable energy to meet requirements for on-site
renewable energy, with documentation
e Incorporating EV-Charging Infrastructure requirements above the amount established in
amendments to the Energy Conservation Code

National Green Building Standard (NGBS)

The nature of the NGBS is different than that of the IgCC, in that it allows for a more selective
approach based on obtaining a certain number of points rather than following a uniform list of
mandates. This allows homebuilders some flexibility in how they meet the requirements. Due
to the scoring model and the recommendation to require third-party verification, staff
recommends adopting the NGBS mostly as published, with a few minor changes to reference
other City codes where applicable.

Below is a summary of the key points of the staff report for the June 2, 2025, work session, and
responses to specific questions posed during that work session.

Responses to Work Session Questions
Q: How will staff ensure review timelines are not delayed by a “flood” of applications
approaching the implementation date of these amendments?
A: Implementation language, which allows some flexibility for projects currently in early
design or conceptual phases.
“The effective date of these amendments shall be 180 days from the date of
adoption. Exception:

1. Projects for which a contract for design or construction is signed prior
to the effective date. First application for building permit shall be
made within 180 days of the effective date. The Building Official shall
be permitted to extend the application deadline for specific projects
where applicants submit a written request prior to the application
deadline.

2. Projects for which a contract for design or construction is signed prior
to the effective date, which have a valid site plan approval or which

125


https://rockvillemd.legistar.com/MeetingDetail.aspx?ID=1287314&GUID=CBFFB10A-9405-4E54-A0FA-3077EF45E0BF&Options=info|&Search=

are currently in review for site plan approval. First application for
building permit shall be made prior to expiration of site plan approval.

Q: Third-party verification of residential projects is proposed. What does the process look like?

How long does it take? Will it be challenging or costly for applicants?
A: Staff met with representatives from Home Innovations Labs, the accrediting body for
NGBS Verifiers, to understand the process. Applicants would select an accredited third-
party verifier prior to submitting application for permit, and their verifier would register
the project in the NGBS online portal. Proof of registration would be submitted along
with construction documents for permit review and issuance. At the time of final
inspections, the verifier would submit their final verification report to the online portal,
and the NGBS Verified documentation would generally be available within 1-2 days.

A search on the NGBS Verifiers database returned at least 126 individuals qualified to
verify projects in the State of Maryland, many of them within less than one hour from
Rockville. The cost of verification varies depending on the size of the project, but the
representative from Home Innovations Labs indicated the typical overall cost of
verification for newly constructed single-family dwellings and townhouses to be
between $450-51,000. With only requiring projects to obtain “NGBS Verified” status, it
is anticipated that the average cost for most projects will tend toward the lower end of
this spectrum.

Q: In the Comp Plan, it was suggested that the building code may need updated for improved

soundproofing. Are staff actively looking at proposing better soundproofing?
A: There are Sound Transmission Classification baselines established in the International
Building Code. There is currently no empirical data to support raising those baselines, so
staff from ISD are not proposing any adjustments to the baselines at this time. Sound
dampening materials become exponentially more costly when exceeding code minimum
requirements, which has the potential to conflict with the City’s affordable housing
goals. At any rate, any updates to STC baselines belong in amendments to the
International Building Code. Staff will revisit this question when reviewing the 2024
International Building Code for proposed amendments.

Q: How do these proposed amendments interact with Montgomery County’s codes, including
their Green codes or the Building Energy Performance Standards?
A: There do not appear to be any conflicts between Montgomery County’s
amendments, the Building Energy Performance Standards, and the City of Rockville’s
proposed amendments.

Q: Should we be looking at protective elements for taller buildings for migratory birds? (e.g. less
reflective glazing, physical barriers, etc.)
A: Staff will evaluate this during the review of the 2024 International Building Code and
International Existing Building Code, as amendments to these documents would have a
greater impact than amendments to the IgCC.

126



Mayor and Council History
The Mayor and Council held a work session on amendments to the Green Building Regulations
at their meeting on June 2, 2025.

Public Notification and Engagement

Staff has made a copy of the draft language available on the city website for public review and
comment. Staff has also notified stakeholders and customers to solicit their input. Staff will
collect any comments received and provide responses and recommendations to the Mayor and
Council when this item is brought forward for adoption.

Boards and Commissions Review

The proposed amendments were presented to the Environment Commission for their feedback.

Next Steps

Staff will collect and review responses to the online form for public review and comments and
provide recommendations, if any, to the Mayor and Council when this item is brought forward
for adoption at the February 2, 2026, Mayor and Council meeting.

Attachments
Green Building Code Update Ordinance_Draft

127


https://rockvillemd.legistar.com/LegislationDetail.aspx?ID=7408900&GUID=1AFD48CF-D353-4411-91CE-6FC6F6BED760&Options=&Search=

ORDINANCE NO. ORDINANCE: To Amend Chapter 5
of the Rockville City Code Entitled
“Buildings and Building Regulations,’
Article X1V

b

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF ROCKVILLE,
MARYLAND as follows:
SECTION I - That Chapter 5 of the Rockville City Code, entitled “Buildings and
Building Regulations,” be amended as follows:
Chapter 5
BUILDING AND PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS

* * *

ARTICLE XIV. GREEN BUILDING REGULATIONS

DIVISION 1. GENERALLY

Sec. 5-301. Scope.

This article places additional "green building” requirements on certain_structures-sizes-and

various types of new construction and redevelopment activities within Rockville.

128



Secs. 5-302366—5-310. Reserved.

DIVISION 2. ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

*k*k

Created: 2025-86-10 11:01:31 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 2 of 28
129



Secs. 5-3147—5-320. Reserved.

DIVISION 34. NON-RESIDENTIAL AND MULTI-UNIT RESIDENTIAL STRUCTURESGREEN
BUHDBINGS

Sec. 5-321. International Green Construction Code—Adopted.

The International Code Council (ICC) International Green Construction Code, 2021 2615
Edition, as modified herein, is hereby adopted as the green construction code for the City. One
(1) copy of such publication as adopted shall be housed by the Inspection Services Division and
made available for inspection by the public during regular office hours. Any amendment or
change in such publication promulgated by the International Code Council shall not become a

Created: 2025-86-10 11:01:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 3 of 28
130



part of this article until adopted by ordinance. References to other ordinances and codes of the
City shall be interpreted and applied in accordance with the terms and effect of such ordinances
and codes at the time of such application and interpretation.

Sec. 5-322. Same—Amendments.

The ICC International Green Construction Code, 2021 20615-Edition (IgCC), is amended in
the following respects:

*k*k
Section 101.3 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

101.3 Scope. Except as outlined in section 101.3.1 or elsewhere in the Rockville City Code, Fhe
the provisions of this code shall apply to the design, construction, addition, alteration, equipment,

change of occupancy, relocation, replacement, demolition and removal of every building or
structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures and to the
building site on which the building is located. Occupancy classifications shall be determined in

accordance W|th the Internatlonal BU|Id|nq Code —HGW—GGHSI—FHGHG-H—&S—H—FGI&%GS—FG—FhE—dG&Ig-H—&Hd

Created: 2025-86-10 11:01:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 4 of 28

131



Section 101.3.1 of the IGCC is amended to read as follows:

101.3.1 (2.2) Applicability. The provisions of this code do not apply to the following:

1. Single-family dwellings and their accessory structures.

2. Multiple-family dwellings of three-stories or fewer above grade.

3. Manufactured houses (mobile homes).

4. Manufactured houses (modular).

5. Temporary structures.

6. Building projects that use none of the following:

1. Electricity

2. Fossil fuels
3. Water

7. Additions to existing buildings that do not exceed 7,500 gross square feet in
new area.

8. Alterations to existing buildings where the work area does not exceed 7,500
gross square feet and 50% of the gross floor area of the building.

9. Buildings constructed using an alternative compliance path, such as USGBC
LEED (minimum Silver level or equivalent), where such compliance path is
approved by the building official and, where applicable, certification is obtained
from the applicable certification bodies.

Section 101.3.1.1 is added to the 1gCC to read as follows:

101.3.1.1 Use of National Green Building Standard. Where a project is covered under
the scope of the ICC 700 National Green Building Standard, 2020 edition as modified in
Division 4 of this article, the project may comply with the NGBS in lieu of the provisions
of this code, provided such project obtains a minimum NGBS Silver Level Certification.

132



Section 101.5.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

101.5.1 Jurisdictional Options. The provisions indicated as Jurisdictional Requirements
in Table 101.5.1 are mandatory provisions for all projects.

Table 101.5.1 of the 1gCC is amended to read as follows:

JURISDICTIONAL
REQUIREMENT

SECTION SECTIONTITLE

Chapter 5—Site Sustainability

501.3.5.2 (5.3.5.2) Mitigation of Heat Island Effect—Walls X_No
501.3.6 (5.3.6) Reduction of Light Pollution X No
501.3.7.2.2 (5.3.7.2.2)  Bicycle Parking Location X No
501.3.7.2.3 (5.3.7.2.3)  Bicycle Parking, Horizontal Parking Racks X No
501.3.7.2.5(5.3.7.2.5)  Bicycle Parking, Security and Visibility X No

501.3.8.1 (5.3.8.1) Building Site Waste Management—Diversion 7506 X 50%

Percentage

Chapter 6—Water Use Efficiency

64(—’—)&?11221 :1612 :3] Irrigation System Design, Master Valve X No
64(—’—)&?11221 :1612 :4] Irrigation System Design, Flow Sensors X No
601.3.4 (6.3.4) Special Water Features X No
601.3.5.2 (6.3.5.2) Consumption Data Collection __No
601.3.5.3 (6.3.5.3) Data Storage and Retrieval __No
601.3.9 (6.3.9) Dual Water Supply Plumbing X No
Chapter 7—Enerqy Efficiency

701.4.2.1 (7.4.2.1) Building Envelope Requirements __No

133


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_Ch05/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_Ch06/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_Ch07/1908

701.4.2.3 (7.4.2.3) Single Rafter Roof Insulation X No
701.4.2.4 (7.4.2.4) High-speed Doors X No
701.4.2.7 (7.4.2.7) Permanent Projections X No
701.4.2.10 (7.4.2.10) Orientation __No
701.4.3.2 (7.4.3.2) Ventilation Controls for Densely Occupied Spaces No
701.4.3.4 (7.4.3.4) Economizers No
701.4.3.5 (7.4.3.5) Zone Controls __No
701.4.3.7 (7.4.3.7) Exhaust Air Energy Recovery X No
701.4.3.8 (7.4.3.8) Kitchen Exhaust Systems X No
701.4.4.3 (7.4.4.3) Insulation for Spa Pools X No
7014631 (.4631) OSoupancy Sensor Contols in Commercil an No
701.4.6.3.2 (7.4.6.3.2)  Automatic Controls for Egress and Security Lighting X No
701.4.7.2 (71.4.7.2) Supermarket Heat Recovery __No
701.4.7.4 (71.4.7.4) Programmable Thermostats __No
701.4.7.5 (7.4.7.5) Refrigerated Display Cases No
701.5.4 (7.5.4) Energy Simulation Aided Design X No
Chapter 8—Indoor Environmental Quality

H;éié ?l; :b] Outdoor Air Ozone Removal __No
801.3.1.4.2 (8.3.1.4.2)  Exfiltration No
801.3.3.4 (8.3.3.4) Interior Sound Reverberation No
801.3.9 [8.3.9] Exterior Views X No
801.4.1.3 (8.4.1.3) Shading for Offices No

Chapter 9—Materials and Resources

134


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_Ch08/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_Ch09/1908

901.3.1.2(9.3.1.2) Total Waste X No

Chapter 10—Construction and Plans for Operation

Construction Activity Pollution Prevention:

4.4(10.4.4) - -
1001.4.4 (10.4.4 Protection of Occupied Areas —No
Postconstruction Building Flush-out and Air
1001.7 (10.7) Monitorin No
1001.10 (10.10) Service Life Plan No
1001.11.2 (10.11.2) Transportation Management Plan, Owner-occupied X No

Building Projects or Portions of Building Projects —

1001.11.3 (10.11.3) Transportation Management Plan, Building Tenant X No

Section 102.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.1 Code Conflicts. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a
specific requirement of this code, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in
any specific case, different sections of the code specify different materials, methods of
construction, or other requirements, the most practical requirement to meet the intent of
the code, as determined by the building official, shall govern.

Section 102.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The following codes and local amendments
thereto shall be considered part of the requirements of this code: the International Building
Code (IBC), the International Energy Conservation Code® (IECC®), the International
Existing Building Code® (IEBC®), Rockville Fire Code, the International Fuel Gas Code®
(IFGC®), the International Mechanical Code® (IMC®), the International Plumbing Code®
(IPC®), the International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC), and the International
Residential Code® (IRC®).

Section 102.4.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.4.1 Conflicting Provisions. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this code
and referenced codes and standards, the most restrictive provisions, as determined by the
building official, shall apply.

Section 102.6 of the 1gCC is amended to read as follows:

102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of
adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically
covered in this code, the International Building Code, the International Existing Building
Code, the International Property Maintenance Code, or the Rockville Fire Code, or as is
deemed necessary by the Building Official for the general safety and welfare of building
occupants and the public.

135


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_Ch10/1908

Section 103 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
**kx
. ; ) of 1 ic doleted

Section 108.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108.2 Schedule of permit fees. Where a permit is required, a fee for each permit shall be
paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by resolution of the
Mayor and Council.

Section 108.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any
work before obtaining the necessary permits, except as provided for elsewhere in the City
Code, shall be subject to an investigation fee as set forth by resolution, in addition to the
required permit fees.

Section 108.6 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 111108 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108 Board-of-Adjustmentsand-111-Means of Appeals. Appeals of administrative

interpretations or decisions made by the Building Official shall be administered in
accordance with Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-12 of the Rockville City Code.

Section 301.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:
301.1 (3.1) General.

Certain terms, abbreviations, and acronyms are defined in this section for the purposes of
this code. These definitions are applicable to all sections of this code.

Terms that are not defined herein, but that are defined in standards that are referenced
herein (Informative Note: e.g., ANSI/ASHRAE/IES Standard 90.1), shall have the
meanings as defined in those standards.

Other terms that are not defined shall have their ordinarily accepted meanings within the
context in which they are used. Ordinarily accepted meanings shall be based on American
standard English language usage, as documented in an approved unabridged dictionary.

Where terms defined herein appear elsewhere in the Rockville City Code, such terms shall
have the meaning herein applied only in reference to the application of this code. Where
there is a conflict between definitions, the building official shall determine the applicable
definition.

Section 501.3.1 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.3 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

501.3.4 (5.3.4) Stormwater management. Stormwater management systems shall be in
accordance with Chapter 19 of the Rockville City Code.

136



Sections 501.3.4.1 through 501.3.4.6 of the IgCC are deleted in their entirety
Section 501.3.5.1 and 501.3.5.2 of the IgCC are deleted in their entirety
Section 501.3.5.5 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

501.3.5.5 (5.3.5.5)Vegetated terrace and roofing systems.

Vegetated terrace and roofing systems, where provided in accordance with Section
501.3.5.3 (5.3.5.3), shall comply with the following:

1. All plantings shall be capable of withstanding the microclimate conditions of the
vegetated area, including but not limited to wind, precipitation, and
temperature. Plants shall be selected and placed to provide foliage coverage of not
less than 50% of designed area of vegetation based on the anticipated plant growth
within two years of the issuance of the final certificate of occupancy. Construction
documents shall be submitted that show the planting location and anticipated two-
year foliage coverage of the plantings. Duplicate coverage shall not be credited
where multiple plants cover the same area. Invasive plants shall not be planted.

2. The growing medium shall be designed for the physical conditions and local climate
to support the plants selected. The planting design shall include measures to protect
the growing medium until the plants are established. The maximum wet weight and
water-holding capacity of a growing medium shall be determined in accordance
with ASTM E2399.

3. Non-vegetated clearances and borders shall be provided in accordance with
the Rockville Fire Code

4. Plantings shall be capable of maintaining the function of the vegetated roof or
terrace as required by Section 1001.9.1 (10.9.1).

5. lIrrigation of the vegetated roofsand terraces shall comply with Section
601.3.2.4 (6.3.2.4).

6. Installation of plantings shall be in accordance with the roof-covering
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Section 501.3.6 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.7 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.8.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

501.3.8.1 (5.3.8.1)Building site waste management Plan.

A building site waste management plan shall be developed and implemented for
excavated soil, rock, and land-clearing debris. Land-clearing debris is limited to stumps
and vegetation. Diverted land-clearing debris and removed rock and soil shall not be sent
to sites where development activity is prohibited by Section 501.3.1.2 (5.3.1.2) or

to greenfields other than those being used for agricultural purposes or being developed as
part of a building project.

Not less than 50% of the land-clearing debris, excluding invasive plant materials, shall be
diverted from disposal in landfills and incinerators other than waste-to-energy systems
with an energy-recovery efficiency rate higher than 60%. Land-clearing debris
calculations shall be based on either weight or volume but not both. Receipts or other
documentation related to diversion shall be maintained through the course of
construction.

137


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch05_Sec501.3.5.3/3047
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch05_Sec501.3.5.3/3047
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdE2399_E2399M_19/3047
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch10_Sec1001.9.1/3047
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch06_Sec601.3.2.4/3047
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch06_Sec601.3.2.4/3047
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P2_Ch05_Sec501.3.1.2/3047

The plan shall address all of the following:

1. Land-clearing debris, rock, and soil to be diverted from disposal by composting,
recycling, or reuse.

Waste materials that will be diverted on-site.

The locations to which waste materials will be diverted off-site.

Soils to be stockpiled for future use at any location.

Woody waste to be used as fuel.

The destruction and disposal of invasive plant materials.

The methods of removal of any contaminated soils.

© N o g bk~ D

The treatment of vegetation to comply with the rules of government-designated
guarantine zones for invasive insect species.

Section 601.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

601.2 (6.2)Compliance. All provisions of Chapter 6 are mandatory provisions.

EXCEPTION: Projects located within Washington Suburban Sanitary Commision
(WSSC) Jurisdiction shall comply with WSSC requirements and are not required to
comply with Chapter 6 of this code.

Section 601.3.1 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections

Section 601.3.2.5 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 601.3.2.6 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 601.3.4 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 601.3.9 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections

Section 701.3.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.3.1 (7.3.1) General. Building projects shall be designed to comply with the Energy
Conservation Code in addition to the requirements contained in this code.

Section 701.3.1.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.3.1.1 (7.3.1.1) Climate zones. Climate zone 4A shall be used for the City of
Rockville in determining the applicable requirements of this chapter.

Section 701.3.1.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.3.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.3.2 (7.3.2) On-site renewable energy systems.

Building projects shall contain on-site photovoltaic systems with a rated capacity of not
less than 2 W/ft3(22 W/m?) multiplied by the horizontal projection of the gross roof
area over conditioned spaces and semiheated spaces. Documentation shall be provided to

the AHJ that indicates an exclusive chain of custody and ownership of the RECs from

138



the on-site renewable energy system to the building owner. RECs supplied from the on-
site renewable energy system shall be conveyed to and retired on behalf of the entity who
has financial or operational control over the building's electricity

consumption. RECs shall be tracked per Section 1001.9.8 (10.9.8). Where the

building owner cannot provide documentation on the chain of custody or ownership of
the RECs from the on-site renewable energy system, the building owner may provide
documentation to the AHJ of an alternate supply contract for an equal or greater quantity
of replacement RECs from an alternate renewable energy source.

The building gross roof area used for calculation in Section 701.3.2 (7.3.2) excludes the
following:

1. Shaded areas that are defined as roof area where direct-beam sunlight is blocked by
structures or natural objects for more than 1500 annual hours between 8 a.m. and 4

p.m.
2. Areas of vegetated terrace and roofing systems compliant with Section 501.3.5.5

(5.3.5.5).

3. Areas designated for public occupancy. Parking areas shall not qualify for this
exclusion.

4. Areas designated for helipads.

Exceptions:

1. Building projects that have an annual daily average incident solar radiation available
to a flat plate collector oriented due south at an angle from horizontal equal to the
latitude of the collector location less than 1.2 kBtu/ft?s day (4.0 kWh/m?e day).

2. Renewable energy systems, other than photovoltaic systems, that result in an equal or
greater annual energy production

3. Capacity shall be permitted to be reduced to that required to provide at least 50% of
the simulated annual site energy consumption of the proposed building project in
accordance with Normative Appendix C.

4. Use of off-site Renewable energy systems that result in an equal or greater annual
energy production, where the owner provides RECs or other approved documentation
to demonstrate compliance with this section.

Section 701.3.6 and subsections are added to the 1gCC to read as follows:

701.3.6 Electric Vehicle Charging Infrastructure. Parking facilities shall be provided
with electric vehicle charging infrastructure in accordance with this section and table
701.3.6.

Exception: Where the proposed activity is an alteration that does not include
exterior work, work in an existing parking facility, or creation of a new parking
facility, this section does not apply.

701.3.6.1 Minimum guantity. The minimum number of parking spaces provided with
electric vehicle infrastructure shall be based on the total number of parking spaces
provided and rounded up to the nearest whole number. Where reductions are applied in

139


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_ChPanel_Sec1001.9.8/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_ChPanel_Sec701.3.2/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_ChPanel_Sec501.3.5.5/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_ChPanel_Sec501.3.5.5/1908
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_appC/1908

accordance with Section 701.3.6.2 in no case shall fewer than one of each type of space
be provided.
701.3.6.1.1 More than one parking facility. Where more than one parking facility is

provided on a building site, the number of parking spaces provided with electric vehicle
infrastructure shall be calculated separately for each parking facility.

701.3.6.1.2 Serving multiple occupancies. Where one shared parking facility serves
multiple building occupancies, the required number of parking spaces provided with
electric vehicle infrastructure shall be determined proportionally based on the floor area
of each building occupancy.

701.3.6.1.3 Accessible spaces. The required number of parking spaces provided with
electric vehicle infrastructure that are designed for accessibility shall be in accordance
with Section 1107.2 of the International Building Code. None of the reductions permitted
by section C405.14.2 shall reduce the number of required accessible spaces.

701.3.6.2 Reductions. The minimum number of spaces required to be provided with
electric vehicle charging infrastructure may be reduced as follows:

1. The number of required EVSE-Installed spaces for Groups A, B, E, F, I, M and
S-2 Occupancies may be reduced by ten (10) for each DC Fast-
Charging EVSE installed.

2. Parking spaces designated for vehicles other than passenger vehicles are
permitted to be excluded from the total number of on-site parking spaces.

3. Parking spaces designated for quick transactions, such as takeout, pickup, and
drop-off are permitted to be excluded from the total number of on-site parking

spaces.
4. EVSE-installed spaces above the minimum required number are permitted to be

installed to meet the minimum required number of EV-Ready Spaces or the
minimum required number of EV-Capable Spaces.

5. EV-Ready spaces above the minimum required number are permitted to be
installed to meet the minimum required number of EVV-Capable Spaces.

6. The number of required EVV-Capable Spaces for Groups R-1, R-2 and R-4
Occupancies may be reduced by 50% where a Long-Term EV Charging
Management Plan has been submitted and approved by the building official.

TABLE 701.3.6 ELECTRIC VEHICLE CHARGING INFRASTRUCTURE
REQUIREMENTS

OCCUPANCY EVSE EVSE READY EVSE CAPABLE
GROUP INSTALLED
Groups A, B, E, F, 5% 10% 25%
I, M, S-2
Groups R-1. R-2, R- 15% 25% 65%
4

140



701.3.6.3 Classification of Spaces. The parking spaces required by this section shall be
classified in accordance with 701.3.6.3.1, 701.3.6.3.2, or 701.3.6.3.3.

701.3.6.3.1 EVV-Capable Spaces. For a parking space to qualify as an EVV-Capable Space,

the following requirements must be met:

1. A raceway or other approved means of cable protection, installed between the
panel and the point of termination.

2. The point of termination shall be an approved enclosure, such as a junction
box, and shall be installed within 36" (914 mm) of the parking space, or within
close proximity of the parking space, as determined by the Building Official.

3. Dedicated physical space shall be provided within the panel for future
installation of a 40-ampere overcurrent protective device.

4. Durable approved labels shall be installed at the panel and the point of
termination, identifying the infrastructure "For Electric Vehicle Charging"

701.3.6.3.2 EV Ready Spaces. For a parking space to qualify as an EVV-Ready Space, a
dedicated 40-Ampere, 208/240v branch circuit shall be provided, which meets all of the
following requirements:

1. The branch circuit shall serve no other appliances or equipment

2. The branch circuit shall terminate in an approved enclosure within 36" (914
mm) of the parking space, or where site conditions prohibit, within close
proximity of the parking space, as determined by the Building Official.

3. The overcurrent protective device and the approved enclosure in which the
circuit terminates shall be provided with durable approved labels, identifying the
infrastructure "For Electric Vehicle Charging."

701.3.6.3.3 EV-Installed Spaces. Equipment serving EVSE-Installed Spaces shall meet
all of the following requirements:

1. The equipment shall meet the criteria for Level 2 charging established in § 12-
205 of the Maryland State Code.

Exception: Where connected to an approved Automatic Load
Management System (ALMS), the EVSE shall be permitted to supply a
reduced output, provided that every EVSE connected to the ALMS is
capable of charging at a minimum rate of 1.4 kW simultaneously.

2. The equipment shall be located within 36" of the parking space, or where site
conditions prohibit, within close proximity of the parking space, as determined by
the Building Official.

Section 701.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4 (7.4) Prescriptive option. Where a more stringent requirement is provided in this
section, it supersedes the requirement in the Energy Conservation Code. For all other
criteria, the building project shall comply with the requirements of the Energy
Conservation Code.

Section 701.4.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

141



701.4.2 (7.4.2) Building envelope. The building envelope shall comply with the Energy

Conservation Code, with the following modifications and additions.

701.4.2.1 (7.4.2.1)[JO] Building envelope requirements.

For a conditioned space, the building envelope shall comply with either the nonresidential or

residential requirements in Tables 701.4.2.1(1) through 701.4.2.1(4)

Exceptions:

1. Spacesthat meet the

requirements of Section 801.4.1 (8.4.1),

regardless

of space area, are exempt from the SHGC criteria for skylights.

TABLE 701.4.2.1(1)

NONRESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (OPAQUE

ELEMENTYS)

Roofs

Assembly Maximum

Insulation Min. R-Value

Insulation entirely above | U-0.030 R-30 c.i.

roof deck

Metal Buildings U-0.035 R-19 + R-11 Ls or R-25 +R-8 Ls

Attic and other U-0.020 R-49
Walls, above grade

Mass U-0.099 R-9.5 c.i.

Metal building U-0.057 R-0 + R-15.8 c.i.

Metal framed U-0.061 R-13 + R-7.5 c.i.

Wood framed and other U-0.061 R-13 + R-3.8 c.i. or R-20
Walls, below grade

Below-grade wall [ C-0.113 | R-7.5 c.i.

Floors

Mass U-0.054 R-14.6 c.i.

Joist/framing U-0.031 R-30
Slab-on-grade floors

Unheated slabs F-0.49 R-15 for 24 in.

Heated slabs F-0.59 R-20 for 24 in.

Opaqgue doors

Nonswinging door U-0.29

Swinging door U-0.35

Garage door <14% U-0.29

glazing

TABLE 701.4.2.1(2)

NONRESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (FENESTRATION)

Fenestration

Assembly Max.
U-

Assembly Max. SHGC

Assembly Min.

VT/SHGC

142


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IGCC2021P1_ChPanel_Sec801.4.1/1908

Vertical Fenestration, 0% to 30% of wall

East- or West-
Facing
Fixed 0.34 0.36 0.34 1.10
Operable 0.43 0.33 0.32
Entrance Door 0.60 0.33 0.32

Skylight, 0% to 3% of Roof

All Types

0.48 | 0.38

| NR

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (OPAQUE ELEMENTYS)

TABLE 701.4.2.1(3)

Roofs
Assembly Maximum Insulation Min. R-Value

Insulation entirely above U-0.030 R-30 c.i.
roof deck
Metal Buildings U-0.035 R-19 + R-11 Ls or R-25 +R-8 Ls
Attic and other U-0.020 R-49

Walls, above grade
Mass U-0.086 R-11.4c.i.
Metal building U-0.048 R-0 + R-19 c.i.
Metal framed U-0.061 R-13 + R-7.5 C.i.
Wood framed and other U-0.061 R-13 + R-3.8 c.i. or R-20

Walls, below grade
Below-grade wall | C-0.087 \ R-10 c.i.

Floors

Mass U-0.048 R-16.7 c.i.
Joist/framing U-0.031 R-30

Slab-on-grade floors
Unheated slabs F-0.49 R-15 for 24 in.
Heated slabs F-0.65 R-20 for 24 in.

Opaqgue doors

Nonswinging door U-0.29
Swinging door U-0.35
Garage door <14% U-0.29
glazing

TABLE 701.4.2.1(4)

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (FENESTRATION)

Fenestration

Assembly Max.

Assembly Max. SHGC

Assembly Min.

U-

VT/SHGC

Vertical Fenestration, 0% to 30% of wall

East- or West-

Facing

143



Fixed 0.34 0.36 0.34 1.10
Operable 0.43 0.33 0.32
Entrance Door 0.60 0.33 0.32
Skylight, 0% to 3% of Roof
All Types 0.48 10.38 | NR

Section 701.4.2.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.2.3 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.2.6 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4.2.6 Vertical fenestration area. The total vertical fenestration area shall be less
than 40% of the gross wall area. This requirement supersedes the requirement in the
Energy Conservation Code.

Section 701.4.2.7 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.2.8 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.3 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4.3 Heating, ventilating, and air conditioning. The heating, ventilating, and air
conditioning shall comply with the Energy Conservation Code, with the following
modifications and additions.

Section 701.4.3.7 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.3.8 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4.4 Service water heating. The service water heating shall comply with the Enerqgy
Conservation Code, with the following modifications and additions.

Section 701.4.4.3 of the I1gCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.6.3.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.5.4 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 801.3.9 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 901.3.1.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 1001.11 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.

144



145



402 Preservation-of Natural-Resoureces =) jwal
Yes Neo
403 Stormwater Management =] M
¥Yes No
404 Landscape Hrigationand-Outdeor =l il
Fountains ¥es Ne
405.1-405.2 Management-of-\egetation-Seils =! [wil
and Yes Neo
Erosion-Control
405.3 Native plant landscaping = vl
Yes No
408 BuHding-Ste-Waste- Management vl g
Yes Ne
407.1-4043 Fransportation-Hnpact = vl
¥Yes No
4074 Preferred vehicle parking =] iwal
Yes Neo
408 Heat Island Mitigation [wil =)
Yes Ne
409 Site Lighting = vl
Yes No
CHARPTER 5-MATERIAL RESOURCE CONSERVATION-AND-EFFICIENCY
502 Construction Material Management | &4 g
Yes Ne
503 Construction Waste Management vl =
Yes Ne
5034 Mintmum-pereentage-ofwaste vl
material-diverted-from-landfills Yes (50%)
504 Waste-Management-and-Reeyeling vl =)
Yes Ne
505 Material-Selection g vl
Yes No
506 Lamps = vl
Yes Neo
CHAPTER 6-ENERGY CONSERVATION, EFFICIENCY-AND - CO,e EMISSION
REDUCTHION
302130211 Zero-Energy-Performance-lndex vl =)
- - - - A-I:|:
which-i-intends-toreguire-enhanced | zEPL 50

146



EF}GFQ%MG’E&HHQ—MGMGHH&&HQ_ ; M =
= Reporting Yes Ne
Automated-Demand-Response
= IV
= %Hfée-D%ﬂ#W Yes No | ¥es
Buttding-Envelope-Systems vl =}
606 Hdi = -
BuHding-Mechanical-Systems-(as
vl =}
amendee'l} Yes No
606:5-1 Economizer-Systems
= M |4
691 E.IIIE'!!! II. ¥e5 N-e¥es
Systems-{as-amended) i N
6@8 -y o1~ - ¥es N-e
Butlding Electrical Power and
bHed = M |4
= ‘crghﬂﬂgw : _ Y¥es No | ¥es
SpecificAppliances-and-Equipment | 5 M |2
- _ Yes No | ¥es
Onsite-Renewable-Energy-Systems = M |2
- Yes No | ¥es
- @ E
- Completion Yes No
Qutee_tme-Based—Pathway = Vil
Reguirements Yes No
CHARPTER - WATER RESOURCE CONSERVAHON, QUALITY-AND
EFFICIENCY ’
- -
+012 Water-usage-metering-required = v
702.1-702.4 Fitting and fixture consumption — o
] ] it i j
- g = - @ E
through-Drinking-fountain-centrols | Yes Ne
1025 i
Apphianees = M=
Film Processors y -
= ¥es Ne
HVAC Systems and Equipment (as
amended) i N
- Yes Ne
WaterTFreatment-Devices-and
- B @
Equipment ¥Yes No
802 ding | T
BuHding-Censtruction-Features;
; - |F|- ! @ B
HVAGC-Systems
vl =}
Yes Ne

147



v}
No
Post-Construction-Pre-Occupancy & | &
Baseline IAQ Testing No | ¥es
ribited ] =
Ne
T Ervice ol Z =
No | ¥es
v il
No | Yes
Baylighting & | &
Neo | ¥es
Special Inspection and =
TR - I =
Maintenance-Documentation No
TR - I =
Maintenance No
CHAPTER 10 EXISTING BUH-DINGS
I — W 2
Ne
CHAPRPTER 11 EXISTHING BUHDING SITE DEVVELOPMENT
I — TR - I Z
Ne
APPENDIX-APROJECT ELECTIVES
— - oct rall =
be-selected-from-sections-A104 No

148



149



150



151



makeup-water

makeup-water
AL079 Gray-water-collection 5-Yes &Ne
AL08:4 VOC emissions—wall-systems =Yes gNe
Al08.6 Fotal VOCHimit =Yes =No
AL10-405.3 Native-Plant-Landscaping 5-Yes &Ne
AL10-407.4 Preferred-\ehicle-Parking =Yes =Ne
AL10-505 Material-Selection =Y-es aNe
A110-506 Lamps =Yes =No
AL10-604 Automated-Demand-Response-{Auto-DR) Infrastructure =Yes =Ne
ALL0-606-5-1 Economizer-Systems 5-Yes =-No
6089
ALL0-610 Onsite-Renewable-Energy-Systems 5-Yes =-No
ALLL-701.2 Water-Usage-Metering 5-Yes =-No
ALLL-702.5 Apphances 5-Yes =-No
ALLD-704 Water Treatment-Devices-and-Equipment 5-Yes =Ne
AL10-807 Acoustics 8-Yes aNe
A110-808 Daylighting =Yes =No

Secs. 5-323—5-330. Reserved.

152



- CITY CODE
Chapter 5 - BUILDING AND PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS
ARTICLE XIV. - GREEN BUILDING REGULATIONS
DIVISION 5. ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLING REQUIREMENTS

DIVISION 45. RESIDENTIAL STRUCTURES-ONE-AND-TPWO-FAMILY DWELLING
REQUIREMENTS

Sec. 5-331. Applicability.

The requirements of this d|V|S|on shall be appllcable newlv constructed and substantlallv
reconstructed: ' mHhy-dw 3

1. One- and two-family dwellings and townhouses; and
2. Group R-2 multiple-family dwellings of three stories or fewer above grade.

Sec. 5-332. National Green Building Standard, AdoptedGreen-building-checklistreguired.

The ICC 700 National Green Building Standard (NGBS), 2020 Edition, as modified herein,
is hereby adopted as the residential green construction code for the City. One (1) copy of such
publication as adopted shall be housed by the Inspection Services Division and made available
for inspection by the public during reqular office hours. Any amendment or change in such
publication promulgated by the International Code Council shall not become a part of this article
until adopted by ordinance. References to other ordinances and codes of the City shall be
interpreted and applied in accordance with the terms and effect of such ordinances and codes at

the tlme of such appllcatlon and mterpretatlon —A+Lene—anel—twe—fam4+y—elwethﬂg-as—md+eateel—m

Sec. 5-333. Reekvile-GreenHemes-Certification required.

New structures subject to the provisions of this division must earn the NGBS Certified
certlflcatlon prlor to |ssuance of Certlflcate of Occupancv Hemesrmestaemevearmrmmum

Sec. 5-334. National Green Building Standard —Amendments.

The ICC 700 National Green Building Standard, 2020 Edition (NGBS), is amended in the
following respects:

Section 103.1 of the NGBS is amended to read as follows:

103.1 Proof of Reqistration Required. Prior to issuance of building permits for projects
subject to the provisions of this standard, applicants shall provide proof of project
registration for NGBS Certification.

Section 103.2 is added to the NGBS to read as follows:

Rockville, Maryland, Code of Ordinances Created: 2025-06-10 11:01:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 26 of 28
153



103.2 Conflicts. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific
requirement of this standard, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in any
specific case, different sections of the standard specify different materials, methods of
construction or other requirements, the most practical requirement to meet the intent of
the code, as determined by the building official, shall govern.

103.2.1 Conflicting Provisions. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this
standard and referenced codes and standards, the most restrictive provisions, as
determined by the building official, shall apply.

This table in Section 1402 of the NGBS is amended to read as follows:
ICC — International Code Council | www.iccsafe.org

DOCUMENT DATE TITLE SECTION

All7.1 2017 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities

IBC 2021 International Building Code

1CC-400 2012 Standard on the Design and Construction of Log Table 701.4.3.2(2)
Structures

IECC 2021 International Energy Conservation Code

IFGC 2021 International Fuel Gas Code

1gCC 2021 International Green Construction Code

IMC 2021 International Mechanical Code

IRC 2021 International Residential Code

IPC 2021 International Plumbing Code

IWUIC 2018 International Wildlife Urban Interface Code 503.1(8)

11.503.1(8)

kkhkhkhhkhkhkhkhhkhkhkiirrrhkhkhkhhhiiiiiiiixx

NOTE: Strikethrough indicates material deleted.
Underlining indicates material added.

Asterisks * * * indicate material unchanged by this ordinance.

| hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of an Ordinance

adopted by the Mayor and Council of Rockville at its meeting of

27

154


http://icc/
http://www.iccsafe.org/
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICCA117.12017/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICCA117.12017/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IBC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IBC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICC_400%E2%80%9412/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICC_400%E2%80%9412/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICC_400%E2%80%9412/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICC7002020P1_Ch07_Sec701.4.3.2_Tbl701.4.3.2_2/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IECC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IECC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IFGC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IFGC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IgCC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IgCC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IMC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IMC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IPC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IPC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IWUIC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IWUIC%E2%80%9418/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICC7002020P1_Ch05_Sec503.1/1750
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/ICC7002020P1_Ch11_Sec11.503.1/1750

28

Sara Taylor-Ferrell
City Clerk/Director of Council Operation

155



MAYOR AND COUNCIL Meeting Date: December 15, 2025
Agenda Item Type: INTRODUCTION AND POSSIBLE ADOPTION
Department: CPDS - INSPECTION SERVICES

Responsible Staff: SHANNON PATRICK

Subject

Adoption of an Ordinance to Amend Chapter 9 of the Rockville City Code Entitled “Fire Code” by
Adopting with Certain Additions, Deletions, and Amendments the 2024 Editions of the Fire
Code (NFPA 1) and the Life Safety Code (NFPA 101), and All Associated NFPA Codes or
Standards Incorporated by Reference and the Latest Editions of Certain Other NFPA Codes Not
Incorporated by Reference into NFPA 1 or NFPA 101 and By Making Other Minor Technical
Changes.

Department
CPDS — Inspection Services

Recommendation

Staff recommends that the Mayor and Council introduce and adopt the proposed ordinance, at
Attachment 1, to amend Chapter 9 of the Rockville City Code. If the Mayor and Council wish to
proceed with the adoption of the ordinance at its December 15 meeting, the ordinance should
first be introduced, and then a motion to waive the layover period should be made. If the
motion to waive the layover period is approved by six affirmative votes, a motion to adopt the
ordinance may then proceed.

Change in Law or Policy
The proposed ordinance would update the fire code by adopting current versions of the model
codes published by the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA), with local amendments.

Discussion

Background

The City of Rockville strives to effectively administer and enforce its fire regulations utilizing the
latest codes and standards. The model codes and standards are reviewed and amended at an
international level every three years. The State of Maryland adopts minimum codes and
standards, with or without amendments, and permits local jurisdictions to make additional
amendments to align with local conditions and policy, with some limitations.

On June 23, 2025, the State of Maryland made the 2024 editions of the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) 1 (Fire Code) and 101 (Life Safety Code), and their referenced codes and
standards, effective. The City's fire regulations are comprised of the State Fire Prevention Code
and Chapter 9 of the City Code, which contains "local amendments" to the State Code. The city
last amended Chapter 9 in 2018. By adopting the model code, the city achieves greater

156



uniformity and consistency with surrounding jurisdictions. The proposed changes will result in

consistency in Rockville for customers and developers who work in multiple jurisdictions within

the DC Metropolitan region.

The codes and standards adopted by the State allow for modification, provided that the
changes do not lessen the original adopted requirements. It is often necessary to amend the
codes and standards adopted at the State level to make enforcement align with current local
policy and procedures and make the application of the codes and standards on a local basis
more consistent.

CPDS Staff convened a code review committee composed of area fire protection engineers,
architects, and other stakeholders to provide comments on the proposed amendments. The
information received from this committee was used to refine the code language and ensure
that the requirements adopted are reasonable, consistent, in concert with other city and
regional requirements, and enforceable by those responsible. In addition, the proposed
amendments were distributed publicly for 30 days, and comments were solicited for
consideration. Due to this comment period and the minor nature of these amendments, staff
does not recommend that the Mayor and Council hold a public hearing.

The proposed local amendments reflect recommendations from the review committee and
coordination and comments from the Montgomery County Department of Fire & Rescue
Services, the Montgomery County Department of Permitting Services, and the City of
Gaithersburg.

Proposed Changes to Chapter 9

The charts below show the significant changes to the proposed Rockville Fire Code that differ
from what the State of Maryland has adopted and an overview of the proposed code
amendments to the 2024 Fire and Life Safety Codes.

157



Significant Changes to Chapter 9

Sec. 9-18 of
Chapter
9. Inspections and
testing.

Description of Change

Details of Change

Requirements for licensed
contractors to submit/upload test
reports to the city's 3rd party
vendor within 30 days of their
inspection. The new language also
stipulates the timeframes the
uploads must be submitted and
identifies acceptable
documentation.

State Fire Code contains
requirements for varying frequency
of inspections, testing and
maintenance for fire protection
systems. The City uses a 3rd party
vendor, The Compliance Engine, as
the tool for all inspections records
to be stored. The system
automatically identifies which
properties are overdue, what
deficiencies are unresolved, and
where follow-up is needed. The
new language is already referenced
on the Compliance Engine
platform; however, the specific city
requirements should be in the local
fire code to strengthen
enforcement efforts when the
property owners or their licensed
vendors fail to meet the guidelines.

158



2024 NFPA 1, Amended by State Fire Prevention Code

Annex A,
A.10.2.7.1

A.10.2.7.1 The frequency of fire
prevention inspections of existing
buildings should be based upon a
risk assessment of these
properties completed by the
responsible AHJ. Considerations
for this assessment should
include, but not be limited to, the
occupancy classification of the
building and hazards associated
with that classification; the
number, location, and physical
and mental capabilities of
potential building occupants
(especially self-evacuation
abilities); construction design and
maintenance of the property; fire
protection features of the
building; special hazards
associated with activities or
operations conducted within the
building; available fire
department suppression
resources with special
consideration to necessary special
suppression operations; and
resources available for fire code
inspections and enforcement
actions.

New language allowing for a risk
assessment to be completed by the
AHJ to determine the frequency of
fire prevention inspections of
existing buildings. Similar language
is in the previous edition of NFPA 1.
However, this new language
provides the AHJ with clearer
flexibility and authority so they can
make the best decisions for their
communities when considering
occupant risk in existing buildings.

159



Section 10.10.6.1

Unless permitted by 10.10.6.2,
for other than one- and two-
family dwellings, outdoor cooking
appliances, grills, or other similar
devices intended for cooking,
heating, or any other purpose
shall not be used, kindled, or
stored in any of the following
locations: (1) On any balcony (2)
Under any overhanging portion of
a structure (3) Within 20 ft (4.7
6.1 m) of any structure.

The State Fire Prevention Code
amended the standard code of 10
ft to 15 ft. Locally, we are
increasing the minimum distance
from a structure from 15 ft to 20 ft
due to the increased number fire
events nationally and locally
associated with open flames in
outdoor cooking. In addition, the
proposed change aligns the city
requirements with Montgomery
County and the City of
Gaithersburg.

Subsection 10.21.1

Where one or more powered
micromobility devices will be
charged inside or within 15 ft (4.6
m) of a building or structure, the
charging operation shall be in
accordance with Section 10.21

Increase the minimum distance the
micromobility device may be
located from a building from 10 ft
to 15 ft due to the rise in fires
nationally involving these devices.
New language in the State Fire
Prevention Code.

160



Section 11.10.2

All newly constructed below-
ground floors of a building, all
floors in buildings greater than
25,000 sq. ft per floor, and all
floors of buildings greater than
three (3) stories in height must
meet minimum emergency radio
communication system
performance criteria adopted by
Montgomery County Department
of Technology Services. Proof that
minimum performance criteria
are met must be provided in
writing to the AHJ, and testing
shall comply with the following:
(a) Performance testing shall be
performed in accordance with the
technical standards for systems
and testing personnel established
by Montgomery County
Department of Technology
Services. (b) Compliance testing
shall be performed at the time of
occupancy and annually
thereafter. (c) All testing, design,
installation and maintenance
required must be performed by
personnel approved by the City of
Rockville Fire Marshal. Exception:
The requirements of this section
shall not apply to one- and two-
family dwellings or townhomes.

We have used the language from
this Montgomery County standard
for some time without having the
language in our local fire code. It
should be added to the city's fire
code to strengthen our
enforcement efforts.

Section
13.3.2.24.2

Existing high-rise buildings, other
than those meeting 13.3.2.24.2.1
or 13.3.2.24.2.2, shall be
protected throughout by an
approved automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with this
chapter and 13.3.2.24.2.3 through
13.3.2.24.2.5.

This language has been adopted at
the State Level and will be codified
in Chapter 9 due to the critical
nature of the requirement.

161



An automatic sprinkler system

This language has been adopted at

Section shall not be required where every | the State Level and will be codified
13.3.2.24.2.1 dwelling unit has exterior access in Chapter 9 due to the critical
in accordance with 14.10.3. nature of the requirement.
An automatic sprinkler system This language has been adopted at
shall not be required in buildings | the State Level and will be codified
. that have a previously approved in Chapter 9 due to the critical
Section . . . .
13.3.2.24.22 and implemented engineered life | nature of the requirement.
T safety system complying with
13.3.2.24.2.2.1 and
13.3.2.24.2.2.2.
The engineering life safety system | This language has been adopted at
shall have been developed by a the State Level and will be codified
registered professional engineer in Chapter 9 due to the critical
experienced in fire and life safety | nature of the requirement.
system design, approved by the
Section authc_mty having jurisdiction, and
shall include any or all of the
13.3.2.24.2.2.1 . . .
following: (1) Partial automatic
sprinkler protection (2) Smoke
detection systems (3) Smoke
control systems (4)
Compartmentation (5) Other
approved systems.
The engineering life safety system | This language has been adopted at
Secti shall be maintained in accordance | the State Level and will be codified
ection with the approved design in Chapter 9 due to the critical
13.3.2.24.2.2.2 . .
documents and applicable nature of the requirement.
standard.
Each building owner shall, within | This language has been adopted at
. 180 days of receiving notice, file the State Level and will be codified
Section . . . . .
an intent to comply with this in Chapter 9 due to the critical
13.3.2.24.2.3 . . .
regulation with the AHJ for nature of the requirement.
approval.
The AHJ shall review and respond | This language has been adopted at
Section to the intent-to-comply submittal | the State Level and will be codified
13.3.2.24.2.4 within 60 days of receipt. in Chapter 9 due to the critical

nature of the requirement.

162



Section
13.3.2.24.2.5

The entire building shall be
required to be protected by an
approved automatic sprinkler
system within 12 years of the
date of the original violation
notice issued by the fire authority
having jurisdiction.

This language has been adopted at
the State Level and will be codified
in Chapter 9 due to the critical
nature of the requirement.

Section
13.3.2.24.2.6

In high-rise buildings that are not
protected throughout by an
approved automatic sprinkler
system, signage shall be posted
complying with 13.3.2.24.2.6(A)
through 13.3.2.24.2.6(D). (A)
Signage shall be posted at all
main building entrances as
approved by the AHJ. (B) The
lettering on the sign shall be at
least 1 inch high. (C) The lettering
shall be placed on a contrasting
background. (D) The wording shall
state as follows: "WARNING: THIS
HIGH-RISE BUILDING IS NOT
PROTECTED THROUGHOUT WITH
AN AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER
SYSTEM".

This language has been adopted at
the State Level and will be codified
in Chapter 9 due to the critical
nature of the requirement.

163



Section
13.3.2.27.1.1

All new day care occupancies
shall be protected throughout by
an approved, supervised
automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 9.7 of
NFPA 101 [NFPA:16.3.5.2]
Automatic protection is not
required if all of the following
conditions are met: (1) The total
number of occupants in the
occupancy in which the day care
center is located is not more than
300 persons. (2) All rooms used
for day care are located on the
level of exit discharge; (3) All
rooms used for day care have at
least one exterior door at grade
level; (4) The occupancy in which
the day care center is located
does not exceeds 12,000 sq ft in
area.

New requirements for increased
safety in day care occupancies. This
new language is also new to the
State Fire Prevention Code.

Section 20.1.5.8.3

In the following assembly
occupancies, an audible
announcement shall be made, or
a projected image shall be shown,
within 10 minutes prior to the
start of each program that
notifies occupants of the location
of the exits to be used in case of a
fire or other emergency: (1)
Theaters (2) Motion picture
theaters (3) Auditoriums (4) Other
similar assembly occupancies with
occupant loads exceeding 300
where there are non-continuous
programs [101:12.7.7.3; 101:
13.7.7.3]

Language is designed to increase
awareness of exits in assembly
occupancies due to fires and other
emergencies. This new language is
also new to the State Fire
Prevention Code.

Section 14.4.2.1.1

Trash or recyclable materials
awaiting scheduled collection
shall not be placed in exits, exit
access corridors or on egress
balconies.

New language in the State Fire
Prevention Code to address the
storage of these items in the exits
or exit access.

2024 NFPA 101, Amended by State Fire Prevention Code

164



All high-rise buildings, other than | This new language is also new to
those meeting 31.3.5.9.2 or the State Fire Prevention Code.
31.3.5.9.3, shall be protected
throughout by an approved,
supervised automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with
31.3.5.2 within 12 years of the
date of the original violation
notice issued by the fire authority
having jurisdiction.

Section 31.3.5.9

Equity

Structure fires affect community equity by unequally impacting lower-income and marginalized
communities through challenges in recovery, heightened vulnerability, and systemic inequities
in preparation. This ordinance, with its focus on fire prevention, risk reduction, and community
education/engagement, will likely avert this inequity.

Environment

Structure fires negatively affect the environment by contaminating air, water, and soil through
the combustion of building materials. By adopting this ordinance, we can reduce or eliminate
fire incidents and safeguard the environment.

Economy

Structure fires hurt the economy through direct costs such as property damage, business
interruptions, and job losses. They also lead to indirect costs such as higher insurance
premiums, lower property values, and decreased tax revenue. This ordinance, which focuses on
prevention, is likely to reduce occurrences of these events.

Mayor and Council History
This is the first time the Mayor and Council have received the proposed ordinance to amend
Chapter 9 to adopt the 2024 NFPA codes.

Public Notification and Engagement

The proposed code changes were posted on the city website and sent to stakeholders, both
designers and contractors, within the fire protection industry for review and feedback. The only
feedback received came from one design professional, thanking us for moving forward with
adoption. When adopted, staff will notify stakeholders using the same methods.

Fiscal Impact

These locally proposed amendments should have a negligible fiscal impact on the city and can
be enforced by existing staff. The changes should also have no significant financial impact on
the building and development community.

165



Next Steps
Following the adoption of the ordinance, there will be a 30-day grace period before the
proposed changes are effective.

Attachments
Chapter 9 Ordinance, Chapter 9 Fire Code Presentation

166



ORDINANCE NO. ORDINANCE: To Amend Chapter 9
of the Rockville City Code, Entitled
“Fire Code,” to Adopt the 2024
Editions of the Fire Code (NFPA 1) and
the Life Safety Code (NFPA 2024), and
All Associated NFPA Codes or
Standards Incorporated by Reference
and the Latest Editions of Certain Other
NFPA Codes Not Incorporated by
Reference Into NFPA1 or NFPA101,
With Certain Additions, Deletions, and
Modifications

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF ROCKVILLE,
MARYLAND as follows:
SECTION I - That Chapter 9 of the Rockville City Code, entitled “Fire Code,” be
amended as follows:
Chapter 9
FIRE CODE
ARTICLE I. IN GENERAL

Sec. 9-1. Scope.

This chapter shall apply to the construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal,
demolition, use, location, occupancy, and/or maintenance of all buildings, structures, properties
and their service equipment, within the City of Rockville. It supersedes Ordinance No. 8-75,
adopted June 2, 1975. Its purpose is to adopt the 20242018 editions of the Fire Code (NFPA 1)
and the Life Safety Code (NFPA 101), and all associated NFPA codes or standards incorporated
by reference and the latest editions of certain other NFPA codes not incorporated by reference
into NFPA 1 or NFPA 101, with modifications necessary to achieve uniformity and consistency
with certain State of Maryland, Montgomery County, and City of Rockville laws and ordinances,
as well as certain Planning and Development Services policies and procedures. Where this

ordinance differs from any other City of Rockville ordinances or the State of Maryland Fire

167



Prevention Code (COMAR 29.06.01), it does not preempt or negate any more restrictive
provisions adopted or enacted by those ordinances and the more restrictive provision(s) shall
apply.

The provisions of this chapter shall not apply to any building, area or premises within the
City, which is owned by any department or agency of the Government of the United States or the
State of Maryland.
* x %
Sec. 9-17. Permits.

@ fissuance.} No activity requiring a permit by this article shall be undertaken prior
to the issuance of a permit.

* x %

() Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site

authorized by such permit is commenced within one hundred and eighty (180) days after its

issuance, or if the work authorized by such permit does not continue to progress or is abandoned

for a period of six (6) months after the last approved/valid inspection. A failed inspection will

not count as an approved/valid inspection. If a permit becomes invalid, a new permit must be

obtained, including payment of the appropriate fees per the City’s Fee Schedule adopted by

resolution of the Mayor and Council, before work recommences.

(k) Extensions. The building official may extend the time for action by the permittee

if there is reasonable cause. A permittee holding an unexpired permit shall have the right to

apply for an extension, in writing, for time to complete such work. The extension shall be

requested for a justifiable cause. six{(6)-months-afterits-issuance,or i the- work-autherized by

168



Sec. 9-18. Inspections and testing.

* * %

(b) Licensed vendors responsible for inspecting, testing, and maintaining fire

protection and life safety systems must submit their inspection reports and all necessary

documentation to the City of Rockville's third-party reporting system within 30 days of the

inspection.

(c) Inspection reports for fire alarms, sprinkler systems, generators, private hydrants,

fire pumps, standpipes, fire/smoke dampers, and all other fire protection and life safety systems

managed by the third-party vendor must be submitted annually or according to the minimum

inspection frequency specified in NFPA 1.

(d) Reports for listed hoods, containing mechanical or fire-actuated dampers, internal

washing components, or other mechanically operated devices shall be inspected and tested by

properly trained, qualified, and certified persons every 6 months or at frequencies recommended

169



by the manufacturer in accordance with their listing. Reports for commercial kitchen exhaust

cleaning for grease buildup must be submitted in accordance with the schedule of inspections per

NFPA 96 to the third-party vendor. These submissions must include digital photographs of the

hood, ductwork, and exhaust fans taken before and after the required cleanings.

(e)  Nothing in this article shall be construed to require actual testing of facilities
when in the judgment of the administrative authority such testing is unnecessary. No testing
deemed necessary by the administrative authority shall be prohibited. In the case of discretionary
action in determinations of the administrative authority under the provisions of this article, the
relevant facts shall be considered and determinations made in the exercise of reasonable
discretion and all such determinations shall be final in the absence of abuse of discretion.

(fe)  Where an additional inspection under this section is made necessary by failure to
complete or properly perform the work inspected, or by failure of work tested to withstand tests,
such additional inspection shall not be made until the person requesting such inspection shall pay
to the administrative authority the fee established by the resolution.

(od)  Protection of trade secrets. Any information reported to or otherwise obtained by
the City Fire Marshal or designee of the City Fire Marshal in connection with a permit
application or inspection that contains or might reveal a trade secret is, to the extent permitted by
state law, confidential.

* % %

(he)  Acceptance tests. It shall be unlawful to occupy any building, property, structure
or any portion thereof until required fire protection systems have been tested, accepted, and

approved by the City Fire Marshal or designee of the City Fire Marshal.

* k% %

170



ARTICLE I11. DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

Sec. 9-43. Historic buildings or structures.
Underal-cireumstances—the The Historic District Commission must approve exterior

alterations, including demolition, to a property, building, or structure within a Historic District

Zone as required by City Code Chapter 25, “Zoning Ordinance,”’--before-demolition-or-exterior

Sec. 9-51. Duties of the Fire Department.

The employees of the Fire Department are requested to make a report in writing to the
Chief of Inspection Services Division or City Fire Marshal of all buildings or structures that are,
may be, or are suspected to be dangerous buildings. Any employee of the Fire Department
should deliver such reports to the Chief of Inspection Services Division erthe-within twenty-four
(24) hours of the discovery of such buildings.

Sec. 9-52. Duties of the Police Department.

171



All employees of the Police Department shall make a report in writing to the Chief of
Inspection Services Division or City Fire Marshal of any buildings or structures that are, may be,
or are suspected to be dangerous buildings. Such reports must be delivered to the Chief of
Inspection Services Division or the City Fire Marshal within twenty-four (24) hours of the
discovery of such buildings by any employee of the Police Department.

* * *

ARTICLE IV. FIRE PREVENTION CODE
* % *
DIVISION 3. TECHNICAL STANDARDS
Sec. 9-73. NFPA 1, Fire Code—Adopted.

The NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, as issued by the National Fire Protection
Association, is hereby adopted by reference, except as amended by section 9-74 of this chapter.
One (1) copy of such publication, as adopted, shall be maintained by the Inspection Services
Division in the City Hall and made available for inspection by the public during regular office
hours. Any amendment or change in such code promulgated by the NFPA shall not become part
of this article until the modifications have been duly adopted by ordinance.

Sec. 9-74. Same—Amendments.

The NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended in the following respects:
Section 1.7.12.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding the
following sentence:

The AHJ shall be authorized to require plans to bear the stamp of a registered design
professional.

Secti 9 of the NFRAL_Fire Code. 2018 Edition-is.deleted.

172



Section 1.110 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.

Section 1.12 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is deleted.

Subsection 1.132.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding

Paragraph 1.132.1.1 to read as follows:
1.132.1.1 Permits, certificates, notices, approvals, or orders required by this code shall be
governed by the policies and procedures of the AHJ.

Subsection 1.132.6.13 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:
1.132.6.13 Permits may be issued by the AHJ and shall indicate the following:
* x %

Subsection 1.132.8 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
1.132.8 Where additional permits, approvals, certificates, or licenses are required by
other agencies, approval may be obtained from those other agencies.

Subsection 1.143.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition is amended to read as follows:
1.143.2 The AHJ may require certificates of fitness and collect fees for individuals or
companies performing any of the following activities:

1) Use of explosive materials

(2 Fireworks displays involving display fireworks
Section 1.143.12.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is deleted.
Section 1.176.4.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is deleted.

Section 2.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018-Edition, is amended as follows:

173



Where permitted by the AHJ, compliance with subsequent editions of reference
publications shall be considered evidence of compliance with the editions specified in
this Code

Section 2.1.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended as follows:

Where permitted by the AHJ, compliance with subsequent editions of reference

publications shall be achieved by complying with the entire subsequent edition of the

referenced publication.

Section 2.1.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended as follows:
Where permitted by the AHJ, compliance with individual specific sections contained
subsequent edition referenced publications, and not the entire reference publication, shall
only be approved by the AHJ through technical documentation submitted in compliance
with 1.4.1 or 1.4.2.

Section 2.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018-Edition, is amended as follows:
Delete the referenced publication NFPA 5000, Building Construction and Safety Code,
202420138 edition.
Add Rockville City Code, Chapter 5, Buildings and Building Regulations. Wherever
NFPA 5000 is referenced, other than for extracted text, substitute Rockville City Code,
Chapter 5, Buildings and Building Regulations.
Delete the referenced publication NFPA 150 Standard on Fire and Life Safety in Animal
Housing Facilities, 202216 Edition.

Section 2.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended as follows:

Delete the referenced publication NFPA 5000, Building Construction and Safety Code,

2024 edition.

174



Add Rockville City Code, Chapter 5, Buildings and Building Requlations. Wherever

NFPA 5000 is referenced, other than for extracted text, substitute Rockville City Code,

Chapter 5, Buildings and Building Regulations.

Paragraph 3.3.17 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

3.3.17.12 Consumer Fireworks Retail Sales Area. The portion of a consumer fireworks

retail sales facility or store, including the immediately adjacent aisles, where consumer

fireworks are located for the purpose of retail display and sale to the public.

Paragraph 3.3.1360 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048-Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
3.3.1360 Fireworks*. Any composition or device for the purpose of producing a visible
or audible effect for entertainment purposes by combustion, deflagration or detonation,
and that meets the definition of Consumer Fireworks or Display Fireworks as set forth in
NFPA 1124, and as referenced in Public Safety Article, § 10-101, Annotated Code of

Maryland.
Paragraph 3.3.1360.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018-Edition is amended to read as

follows:
3.3.1360.1* Display Fireworks. Large fireworks devices that are explosive materials
intended for use in fireworks displays and designed to produce visible or audible effects
by combustion, deflagration, or detonation, as set forth in CFR 555, 49 CFR 172,
APAB87-1, Standard for Construction and Approval for Transportation of Fireworks,
Novelties, and Theatrical Pyrotechnics, and as referenced in Public Safety Article 10-101,
Annotated Code of Maryland.

Section 3.3.175 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is deleted.

175



Paragraph 3.3.203192.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
3.3.203192.6* Day-Care Home. A building or portion of a building in which not more
than twelve (12) clients receive care, maintenance, and supervision, by other than their
relative(s) or legal guardian(s), for less than twenty-four (24) hours per day.
Paragraph 3.3.203192.7 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018-Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
3.3.203192.7* Day-Care Occupancy. An occupancy in which clients receive care,
maintenance, and supervision, by other than their relatives or legal guardians, for less
than twenty-four (24) hours per day.
Paragraph 3.3.203192.25 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
3.3.203192.25 One- and Two-Family Dwelling. One- and two-family dwellings include
buildings containing not more than two (2) dwelling units in which each dwelling unit is
occupied by members of a single family with not more than five (5) unrelated
individuals.
Paragraph 3.3.203192.28 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
3.3.203192.28* Residential Board and Care Facility. An occupancy used for lodging and
boarding of six (6) or more residents, not related by blood or marriage to the owner or
operators, for the purpose of providing personal care services.

Paragraph 4.5.8.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

176



4.5.8.1 Whenever or wherever any device, equipment, system, condition, arrangement,
level of protection, fire-resistive construction, or any other feature is required, such
device, equipment, system, condition, arrangement, level of protection, fire-resistive
construction, or other feature shall thereafter be continuously maintained in accordance
with applicable NFPA requirements or requirements developed as part of a performance-
based design, or as directed by the AHJ.

Paragraph 4.5.8.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
4.5.8.3* Existing life safety features obvious to the public, tenants, or occupants, and
where not required, shall be either maintained or removed.

Paragraph 6.1.4.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
6.1.4.1* Definition - Day-Care Occupancy. An occupancy in which clients receive care,
maintenance, and supervision, by other than their relatives or legal guardians, for less
than twenty-four (24) hours per day.

Paragraph 6.1.8.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:
6.1.8.1.1* Definition - One- and Two-family Dwelling Unit. A building that contains not
more than two dwelling units, each dwelling unit occupied by members of a single family
with not more than five unrelated individuals.

Paragraph 6.1.9.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
6.1.9.1* Definition - Residential Board and Care Facility. A building or portion thereof
that is used for lodging and boarding of six (6) or more residents, not related by blood or
marriage to the owner or operators, for the purpose of providing personal care services.

Subsection 10.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 202420648 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

177



10.1.2* Life Safety Code. Every new and existing building shall comply with this Code
and NFPA 101, Life Safety Code except as amended by Chapter 9, Fire Code, of the
Rockville City Code.

Paragraph 10.2.7.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.7.2.1 Fire prevention inspections shall occur on existing premises in accordance with

the minimum inspection frequency schedule specified by the AHJ and Table 10.2.7.1

Annex A of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to add the following new

paragraph:

A.10.2.7.1 The frequency of fire prevention inspections of existing buildings should be

based upon a risk assessment of these properties completed by the responsible AHJ.

Considerations for this assessment should include, but not be limited to, the occupancy

classification of the building and hazards associated with that classification; the number,

location, and physical and mental capabilities of potential building occupants (especially

self-evacuation abilities); construction design and maintenance of the property; fire

protection features of the building; special hazards associated with activities or operations

conducted within the building; available fire department suppression resources with

special consideration to necessary special suppression operations; and resources available

for fire code inspections and enforcement actions.

Subsection 10.54.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
10.54.1 No person shall fail to leave a building when notified to do so when directed by
the AHJ or incident commander as a result of a known or perceived emergency.

Subsection 10.54.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

178



10.54.2 Persons shall not fail to leave any overcrowded premises when ordered to do so
by the AHJ or Incident Commander.
Paragraph 10.10.6.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

10.10.6.1 Unless permitted by 10.10.6.2, for other than one- and two-family dwellings,

outdoor cooking appliances, grills, or other similar devices intended for cooking, heating,

or any other purpose shall not be used, kindled, or stored in any of the following

locations: (1) on any balcony; (2) under any overhanging portion of a structure; or (3)

within 20 ft (6.1 m) of any structure. For-otherthan-one-and-two-famiy-dwellings-he

Paragraph 10.10.6.23 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Section 10.10 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
10.10.11 to read as follows:
10.10.11 Fire Pits, Fire Bowls, Chimineas, and Similar Devices.
* x %
10.10.11.2 Use of these devices shall be in accordance with_the manufacturer’s
guidelines.
10.10.11.3 No fire pit, fire bowl, chiminea, or similar device shall be used on any balcony
or under any overhanging portion, or within 2015 ft. (6.12+ m) from any building or

structure, and no less than 3 ft. (0.9 m) from combustible materials.

* * %

179



Paragraph 10.11.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
10.11.1.1 New and existing buildings shall have premises identification conforming to
the requirements of Chapter 9, Article 11 of the Rockville City Code.
Subsection 10.11.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph and Paragraph as follows:
* x %
Paragraph 10.11.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
10.11.1.2 Premises identification shall be in accordance with Chapter 9, Article Il of the
Rockville City code.

Paragraph 10.11.1.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.11.1.3 Premises identification shall contrast with their background.

Paragraph 10.11.1.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.11.1.4 Premises identification shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters

Paragraph 10.11.1.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.11.1.6 Where required by the AHJ, the assignment of addresses to buildings shall be

in accordance with an approved method.

Paragraph 10.11.1.7 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is deleted.

Paragraph 10.11.1.86 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.11.1.86 Premises Identification for suites within a multiple tenant building or complex

shall be individually identified in a manner approved by the AHJ.

180



Subsection 10.11.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is added to read as follows:
10.11.4 Fire Department Access Signage
10.11.4.1 Signage required by Chapter 9, Fire Code, of the Rockville City Code shall
comply with requirements of the City of Rockville Fire Department Access and Sighage

Manual, unless otherwise permitted by the AHJ.

181



Subparagraph 10.14.11.2.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
10.14.12%1.2.6 A fuel break of a minimum of 20 ft. (6.1 m) wide shall be cleared between
a crop maze and any vehicles, buildings, or vegetation outside the maze.

Paragraph 10.15.5.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.15.5.1 Unless otherwise approved by the AHJ, portable and vehicle-mounted

generators shall only be operated outdoors a minimum of 20 ft (6.1 m) from any building

openings including windows, doors and air intakes.

Paragraph A.10.15.5.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

A.10.15.5.1 For the purposes of reducing the distances between the operation and

refueling of portable and vehicle-mounted generators and any building or enclosure

opening, including windows, doors, and air intakes, one or more of the following

conditions may be considered:

(1) Nature of the occupancy of the building or enclosure.

(2) Expected duration of generator use.

(3) Use of certified low CO emission generators.

(4) Actual available distance between the generator and building or enclosure openings.

(5) Installation of approved CO detection within the building or enclosure.

(6) Openness of building or enclosure perimeter walls and ceiling.

182



(7) Physical barriers or other means to deflect generator exhaust from building or

enclosure openings.

Section 10.165 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection

10.165.6 to read as follows:
10.165.6 The AHJ shall have the authority to require that outdoor storage of any
combustible material be enclosed by an approved fence or other protective enclosure to
prevent unauthorized access.

Subsection 10.165.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:
10.165.1 Outside storage of combustible materials shall not be located within 15 ft. (4.6
m) of a property line, building, or adjacent pile of combustible material. The separation
distance shall be allowed to be increased where the AHJ determines that a higher hazard
to the adjoining property exists.

Subsection 10.165.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
10.165.5 Combustible storage in the open shall not exceed 20 ft. (6.1m) in height and
10,000 ft2 in area.

Subsection 10.198.7 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended as follows:
10.198.7 Fueled Equipment. Fueled equipment shaH, including but not limited to

motorcycles, mopeds, lawn-care equipment,_and portable cooking equipment, shall not be

stored, operated, or repaired on any balcony, under any overhanging portion, or within a
building except under one of the following conditions:

* * %

Subsection 10.21.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

183



10.21.1 Where one or more powered micromobility devices will be charged inside or

within 15 ft (4.6 m) of a building or structure, the charging operation shall be in

accordance with Section 10.21.

Subsection 10.21.4(3) of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

10.21.4

(3) Storage of combustible materials, combustible waste, or hazardous materials shall not

be permitted within 15 ft (4.6 m) of the charging equipment.

Section 11.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
11.1.7.1.2 to read as follows:

* x %
Section 11.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
11.1.9 to read as follows:

* * %

Paragraph 11.1.5.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to delete existing

wording and read as follows:

11.1.5.6. Extension cords shall not be used as a substitute for permanent wiring.

Paragraph 11.1.7.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 11.1.7.3.2 as follows:
11.1.7.3.2 Doors #rto electrical control panel rooms shall be marked with a plainly visible
and legible sign stating ELECTRICAL ROOM or similar approved wording in
contrasting letters no less than 1 in. (25 mm) high and not less than % in. (6.4 mm) in

stroke width.

184



Section 11.2 of the NFPA1, Fire Code 2024 Edition, is amended by adding subsection 11.2.1.1 to
read as follows.
11.2.1.1 Duct smoke detection shall be added on both the supply and return sides of all
new, altered, extended, or renovated HVAC systems exceeding 2,000 CFM.
Paragraph 11.3.6.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 11.3.6.1.1 to read as follows:

* * %

Subsection 11.9.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

* * %

Paragraph 11.10.2* of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended by adding

Subparagraph 11.10.2.1 to read as follows:

11.10.2.1 All newly constructed below-ground floors of a building, all floors in buildings

greater than 25,000 sq.ft per floor, and all floors of buildings greater than three (3) stories

in height must meet minimum emergency radio communication system performance

criteria adopted by Montgomery County Department of Technology Services. Proof that

minimum performance criteria are met must be provided in writing to the AHJ, and

testing shall comply with the following:

(a) Performance testing shall be performed in accordance with the technical standards for

systems and testing personnel established by Montgomery County Department of

Technology Services.

(b) Compliance testing shall be performed at the time of occupancy and annually

thereafter.

185



(c) All testing, design, installation and maintenance required must be performed by

personnel approved by the City of Rockville Fire Marshal.

Exception: The requirements of this section shall not apply to one- and two-family

dwellings or townhomes.

Paragraph 12.6.9.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to add Subparagraph:

12.6.9.1 Unless otherwise approved by the AHJ, Christmas tree placement within

buildings shall comply with 12.6.9.1.

Subsection 12.6.9.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended by adding Paragraph

12.6.9.2 as follows:

12.6.9.2 The AHJ shall:

(1) Approve the placement of a natural cut or balled tree;

(2) Limit the number of natural cut or balled trees displayed; and

(3) Order the removal of any tree if the tree poses a hazard to life or safety.

Paragraph 12.6.9.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to add Subparagraph

12.6.9.5.3:

12.6.9.5.3 Combustible artificial decorative vegetation shall be tested by a laboratory

recognized by the Office of the State Fire Marshal.

Subsection 12.6.9.6.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

12.6.9.6.1 Where a natural cut tree is permitted, the bottom end of the trunk shall be cut

off with a straight fresh cut at least 2 in. (50 mm) above the end prior to placing the tree

in a stand to allow the tree to absorb water. A natural cut tree shall not exceed 10 ft. (3 m)

in height, excluding the tree stand.

186



Paragraph 13.1.9 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 13.1.9.1 and-to+ead-as follows:
13.1.9.1(1) Where a required fire protection system is impaired or out of service for more
than four (4) hours in a twenty-four (24) hour period, mitigating measures shall be in
accordance with Section 9-14 of the Rockville City Code.
(2)33-2:9:1 Fire sprinkler systems impaired or out of service for more than ten (10) hours
in a twenty-four (24) hour period, mitigating measures shall be in accordance with
Section 9-14 of the Rockville City Code.

Section 13.1 is amended to add the following Subsection, 13.1.14.

13.1.14 Appearance of Equipment. The AHJ shall be permitted to prohibit any device

that has the physical appearance of a life safety or fire protection function but does not

perform that life safety or fire protection function.

Paragraph 13.1.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

13.1.3.1 Basic Testing. Where required by the AHJ Chapters 11 through 43 of NFPA

101, installations involving two or more integrated fire protection or life safety systems

shall be tested to verify the proper operation and function of such systems in accordance

with 13.1.3.1.1 and 13.1.3.1.2. [101:9.11.4.1]

Paragraph 13.1.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

13.1.3.2* NFPA 4 Testing. Where required by the AHJ or 9.3.5 or Chapters 11 through

43 of NFPA 101, the following integrated fire protection and life safety systems shall be

tested in accordance with 13.1.3.1 and 13.1.3.2.1 through 13.1.3.2.2:

(1) Integrated fire protection and life safety systems in high-rise buildings

187



(2) Integrated fire protection and life safety systems that include a smoke control system

[101:9.11.4.2]

Paragraph 13.2.2.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by deleting the
existing wording and replaced to read as follows:
13.2.2.2 All new buildings shall be equipped with an approved standpipe system where
required by the Chapter 5, Buildings and Building Regulations, of the Rockville City
Code. Where a Class Il system is required, a Class | system shall be installed.
Paragraph 13.3.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 13.3.1.2.1 to read as follows:
13.3.1.2.1 For new ceiling installations, drop-out ceilings as referenced in NFPA 13,

Subsection 9.3.11 and NFPA 13R, Section 6.15 8:45-24-shall be prohibited.

Paragraph 13.3.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 13.3.2.1.1 to read as follows:
13.3.2.1.1 All new buildings shall be equipped with an automatic sprinkler system or
other automatic fire suppression system where required by Chapter 5, Buildings and
Building Regulations, of the Rockville City Code.-

Paragraph 13.3.2.5.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read:

13.3.2.5.1 The following assembly occupancies having an occupant load of 100 or more

persons, or 5,000 or more square feet in area, or located on a floor or other than the level

of exit discharge shall be protected throughout by an approved, electrically supervised

automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 13.3.1.2:

(1) Dance halls

(2) Discotheques

188



(3) Nightclubs
(4) Bars

(5) Restaurants

(6) Assembly occupancies with festival seating

[101:12.3.5.1]

Subparagraph 13.3.2.24.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition is deleted and replaced with

the following:

13.3.2.24.2* Existing high-rise buildings, other than those meeting 13.3.2.24.2.1 or

13.3.2.24.2.2, shall be protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with this chapter and 13.3.2.24.2.3 through 13.3.2.24.2.5

13.3.2.24.2.1 An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required where every dwelling

unit has exterior exit access in accordance with 14.10.3.

13.3.2.24.2.2 An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required in buildings that have a

previously approved and implemented engineered life safety system complying with

13.3.2.24.2.2.1 and 13.3.2.24.2.2.2.

13.3.2.24.2.2.1 The engineered life safety system shall have been developed by a

registered professional engineer experienced in fire and life safety system design,

approved by the authority having jurisdiction, and inspected for compliance by the

authority having jurisdiction, and shall include any or all of the following:

(1) Partial automatic sprinkler protection

(2) Smoke detection systems

(3) Smoke control systems

(4) Compartmentation

189



(5) Other approved systems

13.3.2.24.2.2.2 The engineered life safety system shall be maintained in accordance with

the approved design documents and applicable standard.

13.3.2.24.2.3 Each building owner shall, within 180 days of receiving notice, file an

intent to comply with this requlation with the AHJ for approval.

13.3.2.24.2.4 The AHJ shall review and respond to the intent-to-comply submittal within

60 days of receipt.

13.3.2.24.2.5* The entire building shall be required to be protected by an approved

automatic sprinkler system within 12 years of the date of the original violation notice

issued by the fire authority having jurisdiction.

13.3.2.24.2.6 Public Disclosure Signage. In high-rise buildings that are not protected

throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system, signage shall be posted

complying with 13.3.2.24.2.6(A) through 13.3.2.24.2.6(D).

(A) Signage shall be posted at all main building entrances as approved by the AHJ.

(B) The lettering on the sign shall be at least 1 inch (25 millimeters) high.

(C) The lettering shall be placed on a contrasting background.

(D) The wording shall state as follows: “WARNING: THIS HIGH-RISE BUILDING IS

NOT PROTECTED THROUGHOUT WITH AN AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER

SYSTEM”.

Annex section A13.3.2.24.2.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to replace

“A.13.3.2.24.2.3” with “A.13.3.2.24.2.5”

Subparagraph 13.2.25.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition is amended to delete existing

wording and read as follows:

190



13.3.2.25.5 An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all mini-storage

building fire areas greater than 2500 feet? (232 meters?) and where any of the individual

storage units are separated by less than a 1-hour fire resistance-rated barrier. Fire areas

shall be defined by approved fire barriers having a fire resistance rating of not less than 3-

hours. [5000: 30.3.5.4]

Subparagraph 13.3.2.27.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition is amended to add the

following:

13.3.2.27.1.1 All new day care occupancies shall be protected throughout by an

approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 9.7 of

NFPA 101. [101:16.3.5.1] Automatic sprinkler protection is not required if all of the

following conditions are met:

(1) The total number of occupants in the occupancy in which the day care center is

located is not more than 300 persons.

(2) All rooms used for day care are located on the level of exit discharge;

(3) All rooms used for day care have at least one exterior exit door at grade level;

(4) The occupancy in which the day care center is located does not exceed 12,000 sq. ft.

in area.
Paragraph 13.3.3.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

* * %

Paragraph 13.3.3.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

* * %

Subsection 13.4.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding

Subparagraph 13.4.1.1.1 to read as follows:

191



* * *

Paragraph 13.6.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
* x %
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:
* x %
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 202420418 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.1.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 13.6.4.1.2.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* * %

Subparagraph 13.7.1.7.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

13.7.1.7.6 For fire alarm systems using automatic fire detection or waterflow detection

devices to initiate the fire alarm system in accordance with Chapters 11 through 43 of

NFPA 101, not less than one manual fire alarm box, located as required by the AHJ, shall

be provided to initiate a fire alarm signal. [101:9.6.2.6] This paragraph does not permit

the omission of manual fire alarm boxes in accordance with other provisions of this

Subsection unless specifically permitted by NFPA 101 Chapters 11 through 43.

192



Subparagraph 13.7.1.15.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

13.7.1.15.1 Where required by the AHJ and another section of this Code, a risk analysis

for mass notification systems shall be provided in accordance with the requirements of

Chapter 24 of NFPA 72. [101:9.14.1]

Sub-subparagraph 13.7.2.5.6.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

13.7.2.5.6.4 Single-station or multiple-station smoke alarms or smoke detectors shall be

provided in all rooms used for sleeping in accordance with 13.7.1.8. [101:16.6.3.4.4] For

compliance with NFPA 101, Paragraph 43.7.2.1(2), approved battery-powered smoke

alarms, rather than house electrical service-powered smoke alarms shall be permitted

where the facility has testing, maintenance, and smoke alarm replacement programs that

ensure reliability of power to the smoke alarms.

Sub-subparagraph 13.7.2.6.6.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

Approved battery-powered smoke alarms, rather than house electrical service—powered

smoke alarms required by 13.7.2.6.6.4, shall be permitted where the facility has testing,

maintenance, and smoke alarm replacement programs that ensure reliability of power to

the smoke alarms. [101:17.6.3.4.5]

Sub-subparagraph 13.7.2.22.8.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

13.7.2.22.8.1 All living areas, as defined in 3.3.24.5 of NFPA 101, and all corridors shall

be provided with smoke detectors that comply with NFPA 72 and are arranged to initiate

193


https://link.nfpa.org/publications/1/2024/chapters/13#ID000010003362

an alarm that is audible in all sleeping areas, as modified by 13.7.2.22.8.3.

[101:33.3.3.4.8.1]

Sub-subparagraph 13.7.2.22.8.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is deleted.

Sub-subparagraph 13.7.2.28.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* x %
Sub-subparagraph 13.7.2.28.1.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* * %

Paragraph 14.4.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to add the following

sub-paragraph, 14.4.2.1.1:

14.4.2.1.1 Trash or recyclable materials awaiting scheduled collection shall not be placed

in exits, exit access corridors or on eqgress balconies.

Sub-paragraph 14.5.2.3.7 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

14.5.2.3.7 Two releasing motions shall be permitted for existing hardware on a door leaf

serving an area having an occupant load not exceeding three, provided that releasing does

not require simultaneous operations. [101:7.2.1.5.3.7] The locking device shall be of a

type that is readily distinquishable as locked.

Sub-paragraph 14.5.2.3.8 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

14.5.2.3.8 Two releasing motions shall be permitted in existing educational occupancies

in accordance with 15.2.2.2.4 of NFPA 101 and in existing day care occupancies in

194



accordance with 17.2.2.2.6 of NFPA 101. [101:7.2.1.5.3.8] The locking device shall be of

a type that is readily distinquishable as locked.

Sub-paragraph 14.5.3.4.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

14.5.3.4.1 Where permitted by the AHJ and in Chapters 11 through 43 of NFPA 101,

door assemblies separating the elevator lobby from the exit access required by 14.9.1.6.1

shall be permitted to be electrically locked, provided that all the following criteria are

met:

(1) Door electromechanical or electromagnetic locking hardware is listed in accordance

with UL 294, Access Control System Units, or UL 1034, Burglary-Resistant Electric

Locking Mechanisms.

(2) The building is protected throughout by a fire alarm system in accordance with

Section 13.7.

(3) The building is protected throughout by an approved, supervised automatic

sprinkler system in accordance with Section 13.3.

(4) Waterflow in the sprinkler system required by 14.5.3.4.1 is arranged to initiate the

building fire alarm system.

(5) The elevator lobby is protected by an approved, supervised smoke detection system in

accordance with Section 13.7.

(6) Detection of smoke by the detection system required by 14.5.3.4.1 is arranged to

initiate the building fire alarm system and notify building occupants.

(7) Initiation of the building fire alarm system by other than manual fire alarm boxes

unlocks the electrical locks on the elevator lobby door assembly.

195



(8) Loss of power to the elevator lobby electrical lock system unlocks the electrical locks

on the elevator lobby door assemblies.

(9) Once unlocked, the elevator lobby door assemblies remain electrically unlocked until

the building fire alarm system has been manually reset.

(10) Where the elevator lobby door assemblies remain mechanically latched after being

electrically unlocked, latch-releasing hardware in accordance with 14.5.2.3 is affixed to

the door leaves.

(11) A two-way communication system is provided for communication between the

elevator lobby and a central control point that is constantly staffed.

(12) The central control point staff required by 14.5.3.4.1 is capable, trained, and

authorized to provide emergency assistance.

[101:7.2.1.6.4.1]

Sub-paragraph 14.5.3.5.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

14.5.3.5.1 Where a side-hinged door assembly, a pivoted-swinging door assembly, or a

balanced door assembly is equipped with panic or fire exit hardware. such hardware shall

meet all of the following criteria:

(1) It shall consist of a cross bar or a push pad, with the length of the actuating portion of

the cross bar or push pad extending not less than one-half of the width of the door leaf

measured from the latch stile unless otherwise required by 14.5.3.5.2.

(2) It shall be mounted as follows:

(a)New installations shall be not less than 34 in. (865 mm) and not more than 48 in.

(1220 mm) above the floor.

196



(b) Existing installations shall be not less than 30 in. (760 mm) and not more than 48 in.

(1220 mm) above the floor.

(3) It shall be constructed so that a horizontal force not to exceed 15 Ibf (66 N) actuates

the cross bar or push pad and latches.

[101:7.2.1.7.1]

Sub-paragraph 14.5.3.5.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

14.5.3.5.4 Panic hardware and fire exit hardware, in other than detention and correctional

occupancies as otherwise provided in Chapters 22 and 23 of NFPA 101, shall not be

equipped with any locking device, set screw, or other arrangement that prevents the

release of the latch when pressure is applied to the releasing device. [101:7.2.1.7.4]

Subsection 14.5.8 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

14.5.8 Door Openings in Folding Partitions. Where permanently mounted folding or

movable partitions divide a room into smaller spaces, a swinging door leaf or open

doorway shall be provided as an exit access from each such space, unless otherwise

specified in 14.5.8.2. [101:7.2.1.12]

Paragraph 14.5.8.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is deleted.

Sub-paragraph 14.5.10.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

14.5.10.1 Where required by the AHJ and Chapters 11 through 43 of NFPA 101, the

following door assemblies shall be inspected and tested not less than annually in

accordance with 14.5.10.2 through 14.5.10.7:

197



(1) Door leaves equipped with panic hardware or fire exit hardware in accordance with

145.3.5

(2) Door assemblies in exit enclosures

(3) Door hardware release of electrically locked egress door assemblies

(4) Door assemblies with special locking arrangements subject to 14.5.3.4

[101:7.2.1.14.1]

Paragraph 14.13.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
14.13.1.2 For the purposes of 14.13.1.1, exit access shall include, but not be limited to
designated stairs, aisles, corridors, ramps, escalators, and passageways leading to an exit.
For the purposes of 14.13.1.1, exit discharge shall include only designated stairs, ramps,

aisles, walkways, and escalators leading to a public way.

Subparagraph 18.2.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:
18.2.2.1 Access Box(es). All occupancies, other than one- and two-family dwellings, that

have fire protection or life safety systems installed shall provide an approved access box.

* * %

198



18.2.2.1.41 The size, contents, and location of the access box shall be determined by the

Rockville Fire Marshal lecal-fire-department-in cooperation with the occupancy owner or

management.
Subparagraph 18.2.3.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:

* x %
Sub-subparagraph 18.2.3.5.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to add
the following sub-subparagraphs:

18.2.3.5.1.1.1 Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less

than 20 ft (6.1m).

(A) On-street parking is allowed on one side if the load-bearing fire department

access road is at least 28 ft. (8.53 m) wide.

fire department access road is at least 36 -ft. (10.97 m) wide.

Sub-subparagraph 18.2.3.5.1.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by

18.2.3.54.1.2:3 Vertical clearance for any overhead obstruction over streets classified by
Section 21-21 of the Rockville City Code as Limited Access, Major, or Arterial, shall be
at least 16 ft. (4.88 m) from the finished surface.

Subparagraph 18.2.3.5.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code 20242015-Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

199



* * *

Sub-subparagraph 18.2.3.5.3.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is added to read as
follows:
* x %
Subparagraph 18.2.3.5.43 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding
Sub-subparagraphs 18.2.3.5.43.1 and 18.2.3.5.43.2 to read as follows:
18.2.3.5.43.1 Cul-de-sacs used to provide a dead end apparatus turn-around shall not be
less than 90-ft. (27.43 m) in diameter at the closed end.
18.2.3.5.43.2 Hammerhead or T-turnarounds used to provide a dead-end apparatus turn-
around shall have legs not less than 60 ft. (18.29 m) long and all portions of the
hammerhead or T-turnaround not less than 20 ft. (6.1 m) wide.
Paragraph 18.2.3.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 18.2.3.6.1.1 to read as follows:

* * %

Subsection 18.4.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended by adding the following

Paragraphs to read as follows:

18.4.1.3 Fire flow requirements shall be met using fire hydrants located not further than

2000 ft. (610 m) from the building or structure being served.

18.4.1.3.1 Measurements to determine compliance with the requirements of 18.4.1.2.1

shall be made along a path or route accessible to fire department personnel

Section 18.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Paragraph

18.5.1.7 and Subparagraphs 18.5.1.7.1 and 18.5.1.7.2 to read as follows:

* * %

200



18.5.1.7.1 Fire hydrant spacing may be increased to 500 ft. (153 m) for structures
protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system, in accordance with
Section 9.7 of NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 202420618 Edition.
* x %
Paragraph 18.5.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Paragraph 18.5.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition is deleted.
Paragraph 18.5.10.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read and by
adding the following Paragraph, Subparagraphs, and Annex Section to read as follows:

* * %

Subparagraph 20.1.5.8.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows

20.1.5.8.3 In the following assembly occupancies, an audible announcement shall be made, or a

projected image shall be shown, within 10 minutes prior to the start of each program that notifies

occupants of the location of the exits to be used in case of a fire or other emergency:

(1) Theaters

(2) Motion picture theaters

(3) Auditoriums

(4) Other similar assembly occupancies with occupant loads exceeding 300 where there

are non-continuous programs [101:12.7.7.3; 101:13.7.7.3]

201



Subparagraph 20.2.4.2.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

* k% *

Subparagraph 20.3.4.1.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

* k% *

Paragraph 25.2.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
25.2.2.1 All tent fabric shall meet the flame propagation performance criteria contained
in NFPA 701, Standard Methods of Fire Tests for Flame Propagation of Textiles and
Films, or other approved testing standard approved by the State Fire Marshal.

Paragraph 26.1.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding the

following:

* k% *

Subparagraph 31.3.6.2.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding

item (9) to read as follows:
* k% *

Subparagraph 31.3.6.3.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted and amended

to read as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 31.3.6.3.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.

Sub-subparagraph 31.3.6.3.2.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.

202



Sub-subparagraph 31.3.6.3.2.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Sub-subparagraph 31.3.6.3.2.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.

Paragraph 32.9.3.7 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

32.9.3.7 Emergency Instruction to Audience.

When an audience is present, an announcement shall be made within 10 minutes of the

start of each program notifying the audience of the following:

(1) The location of exits to be used in case of fire or other emergency

(2) The means that will be used to notify the audience of fire or other emergency

[140:4.10.7]

Paragraph 34.1.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

34.1.3 Approved Storage Floor Plan. Where required by the AHJ, an approved storage

floor plan that documents the permissible use of the storage area, based on the occupancy

classification and the design basis of the automatic sprinkler system, shall be provided

and mounted in an approved location.

Section 34.6 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to add new Paragraph 34.6.7

and subparagraphs 34.6.7.1 and 34.6.7.2 as follows:

34.6.7 Standpipe systems shall be installed in all storage buildings having an area of

300,000 sq. ft. or more.

34.6.7.1 Standpipe systems shall comply with Section 13.2 and NFPA 14.

34.6.7.2 Class | hose connections shall be provided at each of the following locations:

(1) In each exit passageway at the entrance from the storage area into the

passageway,

(2) Within every required exit stairwell;

203



(3) At other locations such that all points of the storage area floor are within 200

ft. of a hose connection, unless otherwise required by the AHJ.

Chapter 35 Animal Housing Facilities of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition is deleted.

Paragraph 42.7.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Paragraph
42.7.5.7, Paragraph 42.7.5.8, and Paragraph 42.7.5.9 to read as follows:
* x %
Subparagraph 42.7.5.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
* x %
Subsection 50.8.12-2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to add the
following Paragraphs, Subparagraphs, and Sub-subparagraphs:
50.8.1.72:2-206 Commercial Outdoor Cooking Operations. These requirements apply to
commercial outdoor cooking operations such as those that typically take place under a

canopy or tent type structure at fairs, festivals and carnivals. This includes but is not

limited to deep-frying, sautéing and grilling operations.

50.8.1.7.12::10:2 LP Gas Fuel Requirements

204



50.8.1.7.1.12.410:2.1 LP gas tank size shall be limited to 60 Ibs. The total amount of LP
gas on site shall not exceed 60 Ibs. for each appliance that is rated not more than 80,000
btu/hr. and 120 Ibs. for each appliance rated more than 80,000 btu/hr.
50.8.1.7.1.22.110:2.2 Tanks must be maintained in good physical condition and shall
have a valid hydrostatic date stamp.

50.8.1.7.1.32.110-2.3 Tanks shall be secured in their upright position with a chain, strap
or other approved method that prevents the tank from tipping over.
50.8.1.7.1.42.110-2.4 Tanks shall be located so that they are not accessible to the public.
LP gas tanks shall be located at least 5 ft. (1.52 m) from any cooking or heating
equipment or any open flame device.

50.8.1.7.1.52.410:2.5 All LP gas equipment shall be properly maintained and comply
with the requirements of NFPA 58.

50.8.1.7.1.62-110-2.6 Regulators. Single-stage regulators may not supply equipment that
is rated more than 100,000 btu/hr. rating. Two-stage regulators shall be used with
equipment that is rated more than 100,000 btu/hr.

50.8.1.7.22:.1-10-3 General Safety Requirements.

50.8.1.7.2.12:3-10.32 All electrical cords shall be maintained in a safe condition and
shall be secured to prevent damage.

50.8.1.7.2.22.110-3:2 Movable cooking equipment shall have wheels removed or shall be
placed on blocks or otherwise secured to prevent movement of the appliance during
operation.

50.8.1.7.2.32:1-10-3-3 Portable fire extinguishers shall be provided in accordance with

NFPA 1, Section 13.6 and shall be specifically listed for such use.

205



50.8.1.8 There shall be no obstructions or impediments to immediate escape from

vehicles or other mobile units used for cooking operations.

50.8.1.9 Seating for the public shall not be located within any mobile or temporary

cooking vehicle.

Subsection 50.8.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition is deleted and replaced with the

following:

50.8.3 Tent and Canopy Requirements

50.8.3.1 Temporary cooking operations conducted in tents and under canopies shall

comply with NFPA 102 and Chapter 25.

50.8.3.2 All tent and canopy material shall comply with the flame resistance requirements

of Section 25.2.2.

50.8.3.3 Tents or canopies where cooking equipment are not protected in accordance with

NFPA 96 is located shall not be occupied by the public.

50.8.3.4 Tents or canopies where cooking equipment not protected in accordance with

NFPA 96 is located shall be separated from other tents, canopies, structures, or vehicles

by a minimum of 10 feet (3050 millimeters) unless otherwise approved by the AHJ.

Subparagraph 50.8.8.3.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 2024 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

50.8.8.3.2 Disconnected LP-Gas containers and LP-Gas cylinders for purposes other than

engine fuel systems shall be secured in an upright position during transport and storage.

[96:17.8.4.2]

Section 60.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection

60.1.8 and Paragraph 60.1.8.1 to read as follows:

206



60.1.8 Permits.
60.1.8.1 A Hazardous Materials Use Permit, issued by Montgomery County, shall be
required to dispense, handle, use, process, transfer, store, or manufacture one or more
materials or substances that meet the requirements of a "hazardous substance" per
Montgomery County Executive Regulation 3-1217-03.
Section 65.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
65.2.3 to read as follows:
65.2.43 All storage of display fireworks shall comply with NFPA 1124, Code for the
Manufacture, Transportation, Storage, and Retail Sales of Fireworks and Pyrotechnic
Articles, 20222017 edition.
Section 65.2 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
65.2.4 to read as follows:
* x %
Section 65.3 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
65.3.4 to read as follows:
* x %
Section 65.4 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding Subsection
65.4.3 to read as follows:

* * %

Section 65.5 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242048 Edition, is deleted.

Subsection 65.9.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 202420648 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

* * %

207



Section 74.1 of the NFPA 1, Fire Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to delete subsection
743143

* * %

ARTICLE V. LIFE SAFETY
* x %
DIVISION 3. TECHNICAL STANDARDS

Sec. 9-90. NFPA 101, Life Safety Code—Adopted.

The NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, as issued by the National Fire
Protection Association, is hereby adopted by reference, except as amended by Section 9-91 of
this Chapter. One (1) copy of such publication, as adopted, shall be maintained by the Inspection
Services Division in the City Hall and made available for inspection by the public during regular
office hours. Any amendment or change in such code promulgated by the NFPA shall not
become part of this article until the modifications have been duly adopted by ordinance.

Sec. 9-91. Same—Amendments.

The NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended in the following respects:
Section 2.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by
adding the following:

* x %

The referenced publication NFPA 1124 Code for the Manufacture, Transportation, Storage, and

Retail Sales of Fireworks and Pyrotechnic Articles, 202220617 Edition.

Subsection 3.3.6664 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by

adding Paragraph 3.3.64.3 to read as follows:

208



3.3.66.64-3 Bulkhead Door. A type of door assembly covering an opening in the ground
providing direct access to a basement, the floor of which is not more than 8 feet below
ground level. The door consists of a single rigid leaf or two (2) overlapping rigid leaves
or covers which need to be pushed or lifted upwards in order to be opened. A person,
after opening the door, can walk up a series of steps to escape to the outside.
Paragraph 3.3.154148.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
3.3.154148.1* Day-Care Home. A building or portion of a building in which not more
than twelve (12) clients receive care, maintenance, and supervision, by other than their
relative(s) or legal guardians(s), for less than twenty-four (24) hours per day.
Paragraph 3.3.205196.4 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 2012 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:
3.3.205196.4* Day-Care Occupancy. An occupancy in which clients receive care,
maintenance, and supervision, by other than their relatives or legal guardians, for less
than twenty-four (24) hours per day.
Paragraph 3.3.205.13196-12 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended
to read as follows:
3.3.205.13196-12* Residential Board and Care Occupancy. A building or portion thereof
that is used for lodging and boarding of six (6) or more residents, not related by blood or
marriage to the owners or operators, for the purpose of providing personal care services.
Subsection 4.5.8 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

* * %

209



Subsection 4.6.12.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 4.6.12.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Subsection 4.8.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding
Paragraph 4.8.2.4 to read as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 6.1.4.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 6.1.9.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

* * %

Subparagraph 7.2.1.7.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to

read as follows:

210



* * *

Subparagraph 7.2.1.743 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
7.2.1.7.43 Panic and fire exit hardware in other than detention and correctional
occupancies as otherwise provided in Chapters 22 and 23, shall not be equipped with any
locking device, set screw, or other arrangement that prevents the release of the latch when
pressure is applied to the releasing device.
Subsection 7.7.4 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding
Paragraph 7.7.4.1 to read as follows:
* x %
Paragraph 7.9.1.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
* x %
Chapter 8 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding the
following Section and Subsections to read as follows:
* x %
Paragraph 9.6.1.3 of NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
* x %
Paragraph 9.6.1.6 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding

as follows:

* * %

211



Paragraph 9.6.2.6 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
* x %
Paragraph 9.7.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Subparagraph 9.7.1.1.1 to read as follows:
* x %
Subsection 9.11.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:
* x %
Paragraph 11.8.3.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:
11.8.3.1 High-rise buildings shall be protected throughout by an approved, supervised
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with section 9.7. A sprinkler control valve and
waterflow device shall be provided for each floor. High-rise buildings do not include a
structure or building used exclusively for open-air parking.
Paragraph 11.8.6.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:
* x %
Paragraph 11.11.2.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:
* x *
Paragraph 12.2.4.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read

as follows:

212



* * *

Paragraph 12.3.5.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 13.2.4.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 14.7.2.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 15.7.2.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Subsection 16.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended by adding
Paragraph 16.1.1.8.5 to read as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 16.2.11.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by
adding item (4) to read as follows:

* k% *
Sub-subparagraph 16.6.1.4.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is

amended to read as follows:

* * %

213



Sub-subparagraph 16.6.1.4.1.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is
amended to read as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 16.6.1.7.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted and
replaced to read as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 16.6.2.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 16.6.2.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 16.6.2.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
by adding as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 16.6.2.4.5 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 17.6.2.4.5 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* k% *
Subsection 17.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by adding

Paragraph 17.1.1.8.5 to read as follows:

214



* * *

Subparagraph 17.2.11.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended by
adding item (4) to read as follows:

17.2.11.1.1 For windows at grade the minimum net clear opening shall be permitted to be

5.0 ft2 (0.46 m2).
Subparagraph 17.6.1.1.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* k% *
Sub-subparagraph 17.6.1.4.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is
amended to read as follows:

* k% *
Sub-subparagraph 17.6.1.4.1.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is
amended to read as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 17.6.1.7.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted and
replaced to read as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 17.6.2.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 17.6.2.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to read

as follows:

* * %

215



Paragraph 17.6.2.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 17.6.3.4.5 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to

read as follows:deleted-

Approved battery-powered smoke alarms, rather than house electrical service-powered

smoke alarms required by 17.6.3.4.4, shall be permitted where the facility has testing,

maintenance, and smoke alarm replacement programs that ensure reliability of power to

the smoke alarms.

Subparagraph 22.4.65.1.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to

read as follows:
22.4.65.1.3 Lockups in occupancies, other than detention and correctional occupancies
and health care occupancies, where the holding area has capacity for not more than fifty
(50) detainees, and where no individual is detained for twenty- four (24) hours or more,
shall comply with 22.4.5.1.4.

Subparagraph 22.4.65.1.4 (1) of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is

amended to read as follows:
22.4.65.1.4 (1) Doors and other physical restraints to free egress by detainees can be
readily released by staff within thirty (30) seconds of the onset of a fire or similar
emergency.

Subparagraph 22.4.65.1.4 (2) of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is

amended to read as follows:

216



22.4.65.1.4 (2) Staff is in sufficient proximity to the lockup so as to be able to affect the
thirty (30) second release required by 22.4.5.1.4 (1) whenever detainees occupy the
lockup.
Subparagraph 22.4.65.1.5 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Paragraph 22.4.65.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.
Subparagraph 23.4.65.1.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
23.4.65.1.3 Lockups in occupancies, other than detention and correctional occupancies
and health care occupancies, where the holding area has capacity for not more than fifty
(50) detainees, and where no individual is detained for twenty-four (24) hours or more,
shall comply with 23.4.5.1.4.
Subparagraph 23.4.65.1.4 (1) of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is
amended to read as follows:
23.4.65.1.4 (1) Doors and other physical restraints to free egress by detainees can be
readily released by staff within thirty (30) seconds of the onset of a fire or similar
emergency.
Subparagraph 23.4.65.1.4 (2) of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is
amended to read as follows:
23.4.65.1.4 (2) Staff is in sufficient proximity to the lockup so as to be able to affect the
thirty (30) second release required by 23.4.5.1.4 (1) whenever detainees occupy the
lockup.
Subparagraph 23.4.65.1.5 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.

Paragraph 23.4.65.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is deleted.

217



Paragraph 24.1.1.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read as
follows:

* k% *
Subparagraph 24.2.2.3.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 26.1.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to read
as follows:

* * %

Paragraph 31.3.5.9* High-Rise Building Sprinklers of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code 2024

Edition, is amended to read as follows:

31.3.5.9.1* All high-rise buildings, other than those meeting 31.3.5.9.2 or 31.3.5.9.3,

shall be protected throughout by an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with 31.3.5.2 within 12 vears of the date of the original violation notice

issued by the fire authority having jurisdiction.

Paragraph 32.2.2.3.1 (3) of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* k% *
Paragraph 33.2.2.3.1 (3) of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:

* k% *
Sub-subparagraph 33.3.3.4.8.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is

amended to read as follows

218



33.3.3.4.8.1 In all living areas, as defined in 3.3.24.521.5, and all corridors shall be
provided with smoke detectors that comply with NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and
Signaling Code, and are arranged to initiate an alarm that is audible in all sleeping areas,
as modified by 33.3.3.4.8.3.
Sub-subparagraph of 33.3.3.4.8.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242048 Edition, is
deleted.
Subparagraph 42.3.4.1.2 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
* x %
Subparagraph 42.3.4.1.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
* x %
Subparagraph 42.8.3.4.1.1 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
42.8.3.4.1.1 Parking structures less than three stories not exceeding an aggregate floor
area of 100,000 ft2 (9300 m2 )shall not be required to have a fire alarm.
Subparagraph 42.8.3.4.1.3 of the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, 20242018 Edition, is amended to
read as follows:
* x %
Secs. 9-92—9-94. Reserved.
ARTICLE VI. WATER-BASED FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

* * *

DIVISION 3. TECHNICAL STANDARDS

219



Sec. 9-104. Adopted.

The NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, 20222016 Edition;
NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-Rise Residential
Occupancies, 20222016 Edition; NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems
in One- and Two- Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 20222016 Edition; NFPA 14,
Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems, 20222016 Edition; NFPA 20,
Standard for the Installation of Stationary Pump for Fire Protection, 20222016 Edition; and
NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection
Systems, 20232017 Edition, as issued by the National Fire Protection Association, are hereby
adopted by reference, except as amended by Section 9-105, Section 9-106, Section 9-107,
Section 9-108, Section 9-109, and Section 9-110 of this Chapter. One (1) copy of such
publication, as adopted, shall be maintained by the Inspection Services Division in the City of
Rockville City Hall and made available for inspection by the public during regular office hours.
Any amendment or change in such code promulgated by the NFPA shall not become part of this

article until the modifications have been duly adopted by ordinance.

Sec. 9-105. Same—Amendments, NFPA 13.
Subsection 87.6.1 of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, 20222016
Edition, is amended by adding paragraph 7.6.1.6 to read as follows:

87.6.1.6 Dwelling Units. Antifreeze shall not be permitted to be used within the dwelling

unit portions of sprinkler systems.

220



Subparagraph 9.2.4.1.1*8:15.8.1.1 of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler
Systems, 20222016 Edition, is amended by adding the Subparagraph 9.2.4.1.1.28:15:8. 1.2 to
read as follows:
9.2.4.1.1.28:15:8-12 Manner for Calculation of Residential Bathroom Square Footage.
When calculating the area of a residential bathroom to determine forthe-purpose-of
determining if sprinkler coverage is required, any separate rooms with doors opening into
the larger room contained within the larger footprint shall be counted. The area that a
shower stall or bathtub uses shall also be incorporated into the overall area calculation.

Rules governing smaller rooms shall continue to apply when determining if those smaller

rooms need independent sprinkler heads.

Subparagraph 16.9.10.18:46-2-1-1-of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler
Systems, 20222016 Edition, is amended by adding the Sub-subparagraph 16.9.10.1.18-26-11-1-4
to read as follows:
16.9.10.1.18:16-1-114 When a sprinkler system serves more than one floor, each floor
must be consistently and separately valved by a listed and approved indicating control

valve.

221



(2)8-26-1-1-15 Where a sprinkler system is required to activate a building fire alarm
system, the sprinkler system shall have a separate and distinct water flow detecting
device for each floor and zone.
(b)8:26-1116 The provisions of 16.9.10.1.1 8:16:1-1-1-4-and-8-16:-1-1-1.5-shall not apply
to the following:
* x %
Sub-subparagraph 16.12.5.7.18:272 of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler
Systems, 20222016 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
16.12.5.7.148-+2 The fire department connection should be located not less than 18in.
(457 mm) and not more than 4 ft (1.2 m) above the level of the adjacent grade or access

and no further than 100 ft from a fire hydrant. Multiple connections for the same building

shall be interconnected.

Subparagraph 16.12.3.1.38:372-% of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler
Systems, 20222016 Edition, is amended by adding the Sub-subparagraph 16.12.3.1.3.18-472.1.1
to read as follows:

16.12.3.1.3.18-3#2.112 The number of 2 % in outlets required for system demand shall be

as follows:

1) Up to 749—2 outlets

(2 750 - 999—3 outlets

3 1000 and over—4 outlets

Sub-subparagraph 16.12.48:17:2.3-of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler

Systems, 20222016 Edition, is deleted and replaced with the following to read as follows:

222



16.12.48-37.2.3 The size of the pipe for the fire department connection shall be sized at
least as large as the main sprinkler system riser or the fire pump discharge line,
whichever is larger.
Sub-subparagraph 16.12.5.68-272.4-5 of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler
Systems, 20222016 Edition, is amended to read as follows:
16.12.5.68-17-2.4.5-Where a fire department connection services only a portion of a
building, a permanent weather-resistant sign shall be attached indicating the portions of
the building served.
Subsection 19.1.523:2 of the NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems,
20222016 Edition, is amended by adding the following Subsections, and Annex Section to read
as follows:
19.1.5.1.123.2.3* Water Supplies-Supphy-Safety Factors.
(a)23-2-3-1 Calculations for new systems, or new portions of existing systems, must be
designed with a safety factor of not less than 20%.
(b)23:2.3:2 The minimum safety factor may be reduced to 10% for owner-occupied
buildings.
(€)23:2-3-3 Lower safety factors may be used at the discretion of the authority having
jurisdiction.
A.19.1.5.223:2.3 For sprinkler systems without a fire pump, this safety is based on
pressure demand at the supply point. For systems designed with a fire pump, this safety is
based on both demand pressure and demand flow at the pump discharge. When designing
these systems, all options, except gridded piping arrangements, should be explored to

prevent adding a fire pump.

223



Subsection 28.2.1.7 24-1.2 of NFPA 13, the Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems,
2022 20616-Edition, is amended to add the following:
28.2.1.7 2412 Capacity. Pressure and flow availability for existing taps must be
determined by an interior flow test. In any case the supply information must be corrected
for the low hydraulic gradient. Fire pumps and fire pump tank supplies must only be used

where it is demonstrated that the public water supply is inadequate.

Sec. 9-106. Same—Amendments, NFPA 13D.

Paragraph 3.3.11.1 of the NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-

and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 2016-Edition, is deleted.

Subsection 6.2 (1) of the NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-

and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

1. A connection to a reliable waterworks system with or without an automatically operated

pump. Pressure availability as determined by the City of Rockville or WSSC Low

Hydraulic Gradient shall be used.

224



Subsection 7.1.2 of the NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-

and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 2016-Edition, is deleted.

Section 7.5.9 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low Rise

Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition is amended to read as follows:

7.5.9 Where solvent cement is used as the pipe and fittings bonding agent, sprinklers

shall not be installed in the fittings until after the hydrostatic test has been approved by

the City.

Section 8.3.2 of the NFPA 13D Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and

Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 2016-is amended by adding subsection

8.3.2.1 that reads as follows:

* * %

Section 9.2 Antifreeze Systems of the NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler

Systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 2016-Edition, is

deleted in its entirety.

225



Subsection 10.4 of the NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and

Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 Edition, is amended by adding the

following Subsection, Paragraphs, and Annex Section to read as follows:

10.4.10* Calculations for new systems, or new portions of existing systems, must be

designed with a 10% safety factor.

10.4.10.1 Lower safety factors may be used at the discretion of the authority having

jurisdiction.

A.10.4.10 For sprinkler systems without a fire pump, this safety is based on pressure

demand at the supply point. For systems designed with a fire pump, this safety is based

on both demand pressure and demand flow at the pump discharge. When designing these

systems, all options, except gridded piping arrangements, should be explored to prevent

adding a fire pump.

Subsection 11.2.1.4 of the NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-

and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2022 Edition, is amended to read as

follows:

11.2.1.4 When systems are being hydrostatically tested, the test shall not be permitted to

be conducted with sprinklers installed in the fittings.

Subsection 11.2.1 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-

Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition, is amended to add the following subsection

11.2.1.5:

226



11.2.1.5 When temperatures are below 40 degrees F, the building must be heated to keep

system piping to at least 40 deqgrees F, or a listed antifreeze must be used for the

hydrostatic test of the system piping.”

Sec. 9-107. Same—Amendments, NFPA 13R.

Subsection 5.4.2 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-
Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 2016-Edition, is amended by deleting (1) of the accepted

methods.

Section 6.6.2 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low Rise
Residential Occupancies, 2022 2016-Edition is amended by adding subsection 6.6.2.1 that reads

as follows:

* * %

Section 6.7.1.1 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low Rise

Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition is amended to read as follows:

6.7.1.1 Where solvent cement is used as the pipe and fittings bonding agent, sprinklers

shall not be installed in the fittings until after the hydrostatic test has been approved by

the City.

Subsection 6.11.2 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-

Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition, is amended by adding the following:

6.11.2.1 In all apartment buildings, not less than a single 2 ¥ in. fire department

connection shall be provided.

Subsection 6.11.2 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-

Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition, is amended by adding the following:

227



6.11.2.2 The fire department connection shall be located on a street front, and be 18 to 48

in. (457.2 mm to 1.22 m) from the centerline of the inlet to finish grade.

Subsection 8.2.1-+111 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in
Low-Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 2016-Edition, is amended by-adding-the-folowing

Subsections-and-Annex-Section to read as follows and to add the following subsection and annex

section:

8.2.1 Piping shall be sized using hydraulic calculation procedures in accordance with

NFPA 13 as amended by the City Fire Code, and all calculations shall include a minimum

safety factor of 10% of the system demand pressure to account for minor field changes.

8.2.1.1 #1121 ower safety factors may be used at the discretion of the authority

having jurisdiction.

pressure demand at the supply point. For systems designed with a fire pump, this safety is
based on both demand pressure and demand flow at the pump discharge. When designing
these systems, all options, except gridded piping arrangements, should be explored to

prevent adding a fire pump.

Subsection 9.6.2 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-

Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition, is amended by to read as follows:

228



9.6.2 The volume and pressure of a public or private water supply shall be determined

from waterflow test data or other approved method and shall be adjusted to the low

hydraulic gradient.

Subsection 10.2.2 of the NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-

Rise Residential Occupancies, 2022 Edition, is amended to add the following subsection

10.2.2.3:

10.2.2.3 When temperatures are below 40 degrees F, the building must be heated to keep

system piping to at least 40 deqgrees F for the hydrostatic test of the system piping.

229



230



Paragraph 7.8.2 of the NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems,

2022 Edition, is amended as follows:

7.8.2 Each fire hose valve shall be provided with 2% in. valved hose connections, 2% in.

to 1% in. reducers, caps, and chains.

Subsection 9.5.2.1.1 of the NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose

Systems, 2022 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

231



9.5.2.1.1 Hose connections shall be permitted to be installed at the highest intermediate

floor landing between floor levels in every required interior and exterior exit stair.

Paragraph 9.9.5.1 of the NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems,

2022 Edition, is amended by adding Subparagraph 6.4.5.1.2 to read as follows:

9.9.5.1.2 Unless otherwise directed by the AHJ, the installation of fire department

connections shall comply with the following:

(a) the number of 2 ¥ inlets shall be:

System Demand (gpm) No. of Inlets
Up to 749 2
750 to 999 3
1000 and above 4

(b) multiple inlets for the same building shall be interconnected.

Subparagraph 9.9.5.3 of the NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose

Systems, 2022 Edition, is amended to read as follows:

9.9.5.3 Where a fire department connection services multiple buildings, structures,

locations, or only a portion of a building, a sign shall be provided indicating the

buildings, structures, locations, or portions of the building served.

Subsection 11.2.2 8:2.2-of the NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose

Systems, 2022 2016-Edition, is amended by adding Paragraph 118.2.2.1 to read as follows:

232



118.2.2.1 Where fire pumps are necessary to produce the required residual pressures for
standpipe systems in high rise buildings, separate sets of calculations shall be provided to
demonstrate the demand of the hydraulically most remote hose station and the demand of

the sprinkler system.
Sec. 9-109. Same—Amendments, NFPA 20.

Sub-subparagraph 4.14.1.1.4 412.1.1.3-of the NFPA 20, Standard for the Installation of

Stationary Fire Pumps for Fire Protection, 2022 2016-Edition, is amended to read as follows:

4.14.1.1.4 422123 The location of and access to the fire pump room shall be approved

by the authority having jurisdiction.

* * %

ARTICLE VII. FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS
* % *
DIVISION 3. TECHNICAL STANDARDS
Sec. 9-120. Adopted.

The NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2016-Edition, as issued by
the National Fire Protection Association, is hereby adopted by reference, except as amended by
Section 9-121 of this chapter. One (1) copy of such publication, as adopted, shall be maintained
by the Inspection Services Division in the City Hall and made available for inspection by the

public during regular office hours. Any amendment or change in such code promulgated by the

233



NFPA shall not become part of this article until the modifications have been duly adopted by
ordinance.

Section 10.18%%.3 of NFPA 72, the National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2616-Edition
adds the following:

10.1817.3 Annunciator Access and Location. An annunciator with the following features
is required when the building is greater than one story, has a sprinkler system, or has more than
one type of alarm initiating device.

* % *

Paragraph 10.21.5 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2016-Edition,
is amended to read as follows:

* k% %

Paragraph 17.7.6.4.2.1 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 Edition,

is amended by adding subparagraph 17.7.6.4.2.1.1 to read as follows:

17.7.6.4.2.1.1 Duct detection, if provided, must sound a supervisory signal.

Paragraph 17.7.6.4.2.2 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 Edition,

is amended by adding subparagraph 17.7.6.4.2.1.1 to read as follows:

17.7.6.4.2.2.1 Duct detection, if provided, must sound a supervisory signal.

Paragraph 17.1312.2 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2016

Edition, is amended to by adding subparagraph 17.1312.2.1 to read as follows:

68

234



17.1332.2.1 Standpipe or main water flow indicators, if provided, must sound a
supervisory signal.

Section 18.3 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 20618-Edition, is
amended by adding Sub-section 18.3.8% to read as follows:

18.3.8% Calculations. Calculations for amperage capacity of notification circuits shall
provide for a minimum of a 20 percent safety factor on each circuit.

Subsection 18.4.1 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2616 Edition,
is amended by adding Paragraph 18.4.1.8% to read as follows:

18.4.1.87 Where variable volume settings are provided with an audible device, the
spacing shall be based on the low volume level.

Paragraph 24.8.1615 of the NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2016
Edition, is amended to read as follows:

24.8.1615 If telephone jacks are provided, six (6) or more portable handsets (as
determined by the authority having jurisdiction) shall be stored at each control center for use by
emergency responders.

Paragraph 29.118.3.4 of the NFPA 72 National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2022 2016
Edition, is amended by adding the following subsection:

29.118:3.4(14) Enclosed rooms with a closet such as dens, libraries, studies, or sitting

rooms which could be used as a sleeping area must be treated as bedrooms.

* k% %

69

235



ARTICLE VIII. SPECIAL HAZARDS
* % *
DIVISION 3. TECHNICAL STANDARDS

Sec. 9-136. Adopted.

The NFPA 17, Standard for Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 20242016 Edition;
NFPA 17A, Standard for Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 2016 Edition; NFPA 30,
Flammable and Combustible Liquids Code, 20242648 Edition; NFPA 45, Standard on Fire
Protection for Laboratories Using Chemicals, 20242618 Edition; NFPA 58, Liquefied Petroleum
Gas Code, 20242017 Edition; NFPA 96, Standard for Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of
Commercial Cooking Operations, 20242017 Edition; and NFPA 241, Standard for Safeguard
Construction, Alteration, and Demolition Operations, 20222016 Edition, as issued by the
National Fire Protection Association, are hereby adopted by reference, except as amend by
section 9-137, section 9-138, seetion-9-139;-section 9-140, section 9-141, section 9-142, and
section 9-143 of this chapter. One (1) copy of such publication, as adopted, shall be maintained
by the Inspection Services Division in the City Hall and made available for inspection by the
public during regular office hours. Any amendment or change in such code promulgated by the
NFPA shall not become part of this article until the modifications have been duly adopted by
ordinance.
* * %
Sec. 9-138. Reserved.—Same—Amendments—NFRA-LZA:

70

236



* k* %

Sec. 9-142. - Same—Amendments—NFPA 96.
Subsection 7.8.1 of the NFPA 96, Standard for Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of
Commercial Cooking Operations, 2024 263#-Edition is amended by adding the following
Paragraph and Subparagraphs to read as follows:

* k% %

ARTICLE IX. FIREWORKS
DIVISION 3. TECHNICAL STANDARDS
Sec. 9-161. Adopted.

The NFPA 1123, Code for Fireworks Display, 20222018 Edition, and NFPA 1126,
Standard for the Use of Pyrotechnics before a Proximate Audience, 20212016 Edition, as issued
by the National Fire Protection Association, are hereby adopted by reference, except as amended
by section 9-162 and section 9-163 of this chapter. One (1) copy of such publication, as adopted,
shall be maintained by the Inspection Services Division in the City Hall and made available for
inspection by the public during regular office hours. Any amendment or change in such code
promulgated by the NFPA shall not become part of this article until the modifications have been
duly adopted by ordinance.

Sec. 9-162. Same—Amendments, NFPA 1123.

71

237



Chapter 1 of the NFPA 1123, Code for Fireworks Display, 20222618 Edition, is amended

by adding Section 1.5 to read as follows:

* k* %

Fhhkrkrkhkhkkrhkhkhkkihkhkhkkihkhkkihhkkihhkkihhkiihkiiiikx

NOTE: Strikethrough indicates material deleted.
Underlining indicates material added.

Asterisks * * * indicate material unchanged by this ordinance.

| hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of an Ordinance

adopted by the Mayor and Council of Rockville at its meeting of

Sara Taylor-Ferrell

City Clerk/Director of Council Operation

72

238



Introduction and
Adoption of
Proposed Changes
To Chapter 9 Fire
Code

December 15, 2025 City of
Q Rockville
Community I’lun‘ni‘n'gl_{‘ -

239



Presentation Outline

« Purpose

« City Code - Chapter 9, Proposed Changes
- Article | - In General

« Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

« Suggested Motions

« Next Steps

2 rockvillemd.gov

240



Purpose

- Align with the State’s adoption of the 2024 model codes

- Remain a leader in the region in fire safety

Ensure the functionality of fire protection systems in existing
construction

3 rockvillemd.gov

241



Article | - In General

Significant Changes
« Permit Expiration
- Added language to align with Chapter 5
- must have a valid, approved inspection 180 days or permit
expires
- renewal fee per the Adopted Fee Schedule is applied
« Permit Extension
— Added/deleted language to align with Chapter 5
- Grants Building Official authority to extend a permit for a

justified cause

4 rockvillemd.gov

242



Article | - In General

Significant Changes
- Existing Fire Protection Systems —
- licensed vendors must provide inspection and testing reports
of existing fire protection systems and fire protection features
- Specifies timeframe for providing test reports
- Specifies testing, inspection and maintenance frequency of

certain equipment where not currently in the code

5 rockvillemd.gov

243



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes
- Code Edition
- Allow compliance with subsequent code editions where the
project meets the entire code
- Example, a design professional requests to comply with a

new code section in a subsequent code edition

6 rockvillemd.gov

244



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes
« Outdoor Cooking/Heating Appliances
- Model Code requires 10 ft minimum distance to one and two-
family dwellings
- State increased minimum distance to 15 ft
- City increase to 20 ft due to increased number of fires locally
and nationally
- Align with Montgomery County and City of Gaithersburg
« Micromobility Devices
- Powered scooters, E-bikes, and Hoverboards
—When charged outside, increase distance to a building from
10 ft to 15 ft

7 rockvillemd.gov

245



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes
-  Emergency Radio Communication
- New buildings with below-ground floors, greater than 25,000
sq. ft per floor, or greater than three (3) stories in height
- Must comply with Montgomery County Department of
Technology Services
- Current standard, will now be codified
- Assembly Sprinkler Protection Requirements
- New dance hall, discotheque, nightclub, bar, restaurant,
assemblies with festival seating:
- more than 100 occupants, more than 5,000 sq. ft

or located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge

8 rockvillemd.gov

246



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes
- Existing High-Rise Sprinkler System Requirements
- Must be sprinkler protected within 12 years of Notice of
Violation, unless exceptions are met
- Two high-rise buildings in the City, already in initial stages of
compliance
« Public Disclosure Signhage for High-Rise Buildings
- Must be located at main building entrance of unsprinklered
high-rise
- Notification to the public that building is not sprinkler
protected

9 rockvillemd.gov

247



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes
« New Day-Care Sprinkler System Requirements
- Required in all new day-cares unless:
- less than 300 occupants
- located on the level of exit discharge
- rooms used for daycare have a door leading directly
outside
- less than 12,000 sq. ft
- Trash/Recycling for Collection
- Not permitted to be stored in exit paths including in exits or

exit corridors

rockvillemd.gov

248



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes

Assembly Occupancies Audible Announcement
- Projected image or audible announcement required within 10
minutes of start of program.
- Notify occupants of emergency exits
- Theaters, auditoriums, assembly occupancies with more than

300 occupants and non-continuous programs

rockvillemd.gov

249



Article IV - Fire Prevention Code

Significant Changes
-« Tent and Canopy Requirements
- Additional flame resistance requirements
- 10 ft. minimum separation between tents
- Notify occupants of emergency exits
- Theaters, auditoriums, assembly occupancies with more than

300 occupants and non-continuous programs

rockvillemd.gov

250



Suggested Motions

1. I move to introduce the ordinance to amend Chapter 9 of the Rockuville

City Code, entitled "Fire Code."
2. | move to waive the layover period.

3. I move to adopt the ordinance at Attachment 1 of the staff report to

amend Chapter 9 of the Rockville City Code entitled, "Fire Code."

rockvillemd.gov

251



NEXT STEPS

Code changes will be effective 30 days after adoption

Upon adoption, staff will conduct outreach to notify stakeholders of
changes

rockvillemd.gov

252



Thank You!

253



MAYOR AND COUNCIL Meeting Date: December 15, 2025

Agenda Item Type: MOCK AGENDAS

Department: CITY CLERK/DIRECTOR OF COUNCIL OPERATIONS OFFICE
Responsible Staff: SARA TAYLOR-FERRELL

Subject
Mock Agenda

Recommendation
Staff recommend the Mayor and Council review and provide comments.

Attachments
January 5, 2026 (Mock)

254



MAYOR AND COUNCIL

Meeting No. 01-26
Monday, January 5, 2026 - 5:30 PM

MOCK AGENDA

Agenda item times are estimates only. Items may be considered at times other than those indicated.
Ways to Participate

If you require a reasonable accommodation, for community forum or a public hearing and need
reasonable accommodations, please contact the City Clerk's Office by the Wednesday before the
Monday meeting at 240-314-8280 or cityclerk@rockvillemd.gov or by filling this form:
https://www.rockvillemd.gov/FormCenter/City-Manager-2/Request-a-Reasonable-Accommodation-50

Translation Assistance

If you wish to participate in person at a Mayor and Council meeting during community forum or a
public hearing and may need translation assistance in a language other than English, please contact
the City Clerk’s Office by the Wednesday before the Monday meeting at 240-314-8280, or
cityclerk@rockvillemd.gov, or by using this form:
https://www.rockvillemd.gov/FormCenter/City-Clerk-11/Sign-Up-for-Translation-Assistance-at-Co-368

In-Person Attendance

Community members attending in-person who wish to speak during Community Forum, or a Public
Hearing, should sign up using the form at the entrance to the Mayor and Council Chamber. In-person
speakers will be called upon in the order they are signed to speak and before virtual speakers.

Note: In-Person Speakers will be called upon to speak before those who have signed up to speak
virtually for Community Forum and Public Hearings.

Viewing Mayor and Council Meetings

The Mayor and Council are conducting hybrid meetings. The virtual meetings can be viewed on
Rockville 11, Comcast, Verizon cable channel 11, livestreamed at www.rockvillemd.gov/rockville11,
and available a day after each meeting at www.rockvillemd.gov/videoondemand.

Participating in Community Forum & Public Hearings:

If you wish to submit comments in writing for Community Forum or Public Hearings:
* Please email the comments to mayorandcouncil@rockvillemd.gov no later than 10:00 am on the
date of the meeting.

If you wish to participate in-person or virtually in Community Forum or Public Hearings during the live
Mayor and Council meeting:
1. Send your Name, Phone number, For Community Forum and Expected Method of Joining the



Mayor and Council January 5, 2026

Meeting (computer or phone) to mayorandcouncil@rockvillemd.gov no later than 10:00 am on the
day of the meeting. Each speaker will receive 3 minutes.

2. Send your Name, Phone number, the Public Hearing Topic and Expected Method of Joining the
Meeting (computer or phone) to mayorandcouncil@rockvillemd.gov no later than 10:00 am on the
day of the meeting.

3. On the day of the meeting, you will receive a confirmation email with further details, and two
Webex invitations: 1) Optional Webex Orientation Question and Answer Session and 2) Mayor &
Council Meeting Invitation.

4. Plan to join the meeting no later than approximately 20 minutes before the actual meeting start
time.

5. Read for https://www.rockvillemd.gov/DocumentCenter/View/38725/Public-Meetings-on-Webex
meeting tips and instructions on joining a Webex meeting (either by computer or phone).

6. If joining by computer, Conduct a WebEx test: https://www.webex.com/test-meeting.html prior to
signing up to join the meeting to ensure your equipment will work as expected.

Participating in Mayor and Council Drop-In (Mayor Ashton and Councilmember Valeri)

The next scheduled Drop-In Session will be held by phone or in-person on Monday, January 12 from 5:15 pm
- 6:15 pm with Mayor Ashton and Councilmember Valeri. Please sign up by 10 am on the meeting day using
the form at: https://www.rockvillemd.gov/formcenter/city-clerk-11/sign-up-for-dropin-meetings-227

1. Convene-5:30 PM
2. Pledge of Allegiance

3. Proclamation and Recognition - 5:35 PM

A. Proclamation Declaring January 19, 2026, as Martin Luther King, Jr. Day in Rockville,
Maryland

4. Agenda Review 6:30 PM
5. City Manager's Report 6:35 PM
6. Boards and Commissions Appointments and Reappointments - NONE
7. Community Forum - 6:40 PM
8. Special Presentations - NONE
9. Consent Agenda-7:00 PM
10. Public Hearing - NONE
11. Action Items - 7:05 PM
A. Adoption of Mayor and Council Meeting Rules of Procedure

12. Worksession - 7:45 PM

256



Mayor and Council January 5, 2026

A. Mayor and Council Budget Priorities - Worksession
13. Mock Agenda - 8:15 PM
14. Old / New Business - 8:20 PM

15. Adjournment - 8:30 PM

257



